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Start time: 10:00 11:00 12:00 13:00 14:00 15:00 16:00 17:00 18:00 19:00 20:00
Slot 1 Nothing registered so far WELLBEING FOR THE WORLD - 

Presented by Ben Stollery (1.5 
hours) : Come and explore how 
our personal struggles might be 
leveraged for the public (and 
planetary) good. Activism as an 
extension of our wellbeing. 

SOCIOCRACY SIMPLIFIED - 
Presented by Rakesh "Rootsman 
Rak" (1 hour) : Sociocracy is 
amazing at getting people to work 
well and make good decisions 
together. However it can appear 
complicated to implement so lets 
simplify

NEIGHBOURHOOD 
PARLIAMENTS - Presented by 
Nathaniel Whitestone (90 minutes) 
: Neighbourhood Parliaments: 
Why and how? What impact are 
these 400,000+ neighbourhoods 
having around the world? Would 
your project work better in a NP?

IMAGINATION BOOTCAMP! - 
Presented by MindYourFootprint! 
(1 hour) : Imagination Bootcamp is 
a place where we dare you to 
dream and to imagine an 
alternative, better future - with help 
from the #ClimateDice!

Nothing registered so far Nothing registered so far Nothing registered so far CITIZENS' ASSEMBLIES: - 
Presented by Kathie Conn (1 hour) 
: For people curious about how we 
can do better: Find out the 'how' 
and 'why' of a citizens' assembly 
for climate and ecological justice.

FUNDING SYSTEMS CHANGE - 
Presented by Carolina de Oliveira 
(2.5 hours) : Funding strategy: 
what if the powers that be pay for 
the revolution?  Read more here: 
https://nudj.app/event/626

MAKING COMMUNITY FOREST 
GARDENS - Presented by Rakesh 
"Rootsman Rak" (1 hour) : We all 
need to eat, so what better way to 
connect people than through food. 
Food forests are low maintenance, 
biodiverse & nutrient rich. Win-
Win-Win!

Slot 2
THE GREAT BRIT ENERGY 
RETROFIT - Presented by Alex 
Hartley (60 mins) : How do we get 
every possible 
residential/community building get 
kitted out efficiency and generation 
wise when incentives and support 
get pulled?Again

CO-CREATE A CLIMATE 
ASSEMBLY - Presented by Bob 
Bollen (45 mins) : CANCELLED
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Strongly advise you to 
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Slot 1 WHO ARE "WE"? WHERE NEXT? 

- Presented by Nick Anim & 
Richard Couldrey (2 hours) : We 
face both climate breakdown & an 
emergency of injustices related to 
persistent inequalities within & 
between nations. Where do we go 
from here? 

Nothing registered so far IMAGINATION BOOTCAMP - 
Presented by MindYourFootprint! 
(1 hour) : Imagination Bootcamp is 
a place where we dare you to 
dream and to imagine an 
alternative, better future - with help 
from the #ClimateDice!

SOCIOCRACY SIMPLIFIED - 
Presented by Rakesh "Rootsman 
Rak" (1 hour) : Sociocracy is 
amazing at getting people to work 
well and make good decisions 
together. However it can appear 
complicated to implement so lets 
simplify

TRAD - OUR FUTURE? - 
Presented by Transformative 
Adaptation Group (TrAd) (50 mins 
) : 
Dr Rupert Read  gives an 
overview plus discussion  - https:
//transformative-adaptation.com/

MAPPING LAB SUMMIT AND 
BEYOND - Presented by Roxy 
Piper (1 hour or more) : Emergent 
mapping chat to explore creating a 
participatory map to help us stay 
connected & build a picture of how 
to build community power now & 
beyond

Nothing registered so far ARE COMMUNES MAKING A 
COMEBACK - Presented by Mikee 
Whitson (1 hour) : Presentations 
from groups forming communes in 
the UK. Q+A and discussion 
around  Income sharing, 
community engagement and 
political change. 

Nothing registered so far LONDON HUB GET-TOGETHER 
- Presented by Hilary Jennings (2 
hours) : Join London Hub's Hilary 
Jennings and Manisha 
Abeyasinghe and activists from 
across London to explore how we 
can work together more 
effectively.

PUSHING FOR PARADIGM 
SHIFT UK - Presented by Barbara 
Williams (1 hour) : Full details 
here:  https://poemsforparliament.
uk/paradigm-shift-education-
campaign/

Slot 2
NEUROSCIENCE OF SAFE 
SPACES - Presented by Angelika 
Rusbridge (1 hour) : An 
exploration of the way our brain 
works in complex environments 
and how we can look to promote 
safety with this in mind.

EARTH TEMPLES IN CITIES - 
Presented by Azul Thomé (1 hour 
max) : How can a human-built 
space restore a broken 
relationship with the natural and 
invisible world? Earth Temple in 
Cities www.souland.org/earth-
temple 

IMAGINATION BOOTCAMP!  - 
Presented by MindYourFootprint! 
(1 hour) : Imagination Bootcamp is 
a place where we dare you to 
dream and to imagine an 
alternative, better future - with help 
from the #ClimateDice!

Slot 3
NW REGION GET-TOGETHER - 
Presented by Nick Drew (2 hours) 
: Join Transition NW Region's Nick 
Drew and Phil Frodsham to 
explore how we can all work more 
effectively together across the 
North West region.
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