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NEW YORK, ATLANTIC —  Recently, the Greens merged into the Democratic 
Party. This has resulted in many new Democrats and has presented a huge 
chance for the Democratic Party to move more left and be more in touch with 
their more leftist allies. This has created a new faction of the pre-existing 
already leftist Democrats and the new Greens into a New Democrats 
ideology. Atlantic has, for a very long time, been known as a red state. Some 
political analysts believe that the new cooperation between the New 
Democrats and Old Democrats will be able to finally turn Atlantic blue. 

 

Who all exactly plans to run for Atlantic Senate these midterms is uncertain, 



but there is much speculation. Many of the Democrats who were unable to 
win a house seat in the last election are all contenders, such as PGF3 or 
b_fox2, but the most plausible candidate isn't either of those - but the person 
who didn't get to unseat NAM_69_Reenactor's in the senate race. The most 
plausible person that will run is PhlebotinumEddie. Since they didn't get 
elected, they still have plenty of options ahead of them in the future. This is 
discounting the possibility of them going for Atlantic Governor or Lieutenant 
Governor, which is entirely plausible, as no press has come from them 
announcing any of their future intentions, so we can only speculate. 

 

A former Green, PhlebotinumEddie has many policies that have been 
described as generally the center. A Green that supports legalizing Marijuana, 
raising minimum wage, and expanding national parks, with the support of the 
Democratic Party they might have a strong base to build a challenging 
campaign for the incumbent Senator Gunnz, should he decide to run again. 
Perhaps in many future elections, the unified Democrats and Greens will be 
able to provide a strong opponent capable of upsetting the Republican 
incumbents, not just in Atlantic, but in all of the states.  

 
 


