
 

HVAC SEO 

It used to be that HVAC companies would only rely on referrals, word of mouth, and print ads to 
beef up their client list. With increased competition, however, there has never been a better time 
to seek new and more effective methods to get new clients on your business’ fold. That’s where 
finding them efficiently comes into play. And at this day and age where everything is online, the 
race to spot potential customers through online channels is on! 

Consumers nowadays have gotten used to “Googling” their way into finding any kind of 
business. Looking for the nearest garage for your car’s tune-up? Google it!  Looking for the 
most affordable hotel for the next family vacation? Google it! Looking for the best HVAC 
company? You guessed it right. 

 

 

For the new generation of customers to trust your business, your website (and social media 
assets, if any) needs to be in the first page, if not top-ranked, of search results in Google.  It 
goes without saying that having an HVAC website that consistently ranks high in Google search 
results will be a huge asset to your company. For that website to be on top, it must have a solid 
foundation built on best SEO practices. Simply put, a good SEO-based website will rank it high 
on search engine results. A website that is high-ranking on search engines makes it easy for 
potential customers to find you. More customers equal to a successful business.  
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Can you SEO HVAC? 

These days, SEO is a buzzword everyone with a website talks about. But be warned: Don’t take 
everybody’s word for it. Just because “SEO” is trendy, you’d get onboard the train and funnel all 
your resources just like that. You may want to look deeper into it, understanding what it is about 
and why it is that important to have your HVAC biz’s website “SEO compliant.” 

What is SEO, in the first place? It stands for Search Engine Optimization. As mentioned above, 
it is second nature for everyone these days to consider search engines such as Google the 
place where they find answers to everything they need. Thus, for your website to be on top of 
search engine results, you must make sure that it is… you guessed it right, optimized. 

In other words, SEO is a series of procedures that if done right, will catapult your website to 
search engine results royalty. After all, would you really consider businesses listed on page 2, 
page 3, and further on Google? You know you’ve done SEO right when your site is listed on the 
top, if not at least on the first page, of search engine results, has a description that appeals to 
the searcher, and with one click, the reader is referred to your website. Potential customer alert!     

Consider this: Hundreds, if not thousands of people ask Google every single day on information 
about HVAC, heating, and cooling companies. There would surely be a good number of those 
searchers who are on the lookout for HVAC specialists near them. So, if your HVAC business 
doesn’t have a marketing plan that includes effective SEO, your site is not likely to show up in 
search engine results. With that, you can practically kiss your chances of getting a promising 
customer base goodbye, just because you don’t have an HVAC marketing specialist in your 
team.   

  

  

Get Your SEO Groove On for Your Heating and Air Conditioning 
Company 

Of course, it is important to have this SEO guru in your team. But as mentioned earlier, you, as 
business owner, should have at least basic SEO knowledge. That way, you won’t get duped by 
self-professed SEO marketing geniuses who may turn out to be scams. 

In every effective SEO strategy, these two actions are always included: 

Keyword Research 
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Keyword research is more of a pre-event before actual SEO happens. As its name suggests, 
you do some research that will make you discover which words and phrases the people who do 
Google searches use when they try to find HVAC companies or services. Knowing their 
behavior through these words will allow you to ask your writer (or whoever writes the content for 
your website) to make sure these words are present on your website’s text.   Of course, with 
those words in your website content, there is a great chance your search ranking will improve, 
which in turn, also improves your website’s, and your business’ visibility, at least to the online 
community. And there’s a lot of people in that community these days. 

 

 

Not sure how keyword research is done? No, there’s no need to pore through encyclopedia and 
academic journals. That’s not the kind of research being done here. The first online tool you 
need to befriend is Google AdWords. Though it is a paid advertising tool, you won’t need to shell 
out anything if you use it your keyword research. By using AdWords, you will be informed of the 
right “keywords” popularly used by your website’s intended audience (people looking for HVAC 
services). 

First, type in a word or phrase into Google AdWords. In return, AdWords will tell you the number 
of times the word or phrase has been used in a month (search volume) and how expensive the 
word or phrase is, among a wealth of other information. Of course, the more popular a keyword 
or phrase is, the more expensive Google makes it. They must earn bank too, you know.  Also, 
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you will be informed how many websites use this word or phrase. Same with the concept earlier, 
the more websites use a certain word or phrase, the more expensive it will be. The keywords 
you’ll look out for have that ideal combination of more than average search volume and low in 
competition. Those keywords may be used by a lot of Google users, but not a lot of websites 
target it yet. Enter you. 

If you think Google AdWords is a bit too highfalutin’, you can simply use the Google search bar. 
Type in the words that you think would lead to your website. If it’s taking you overly imagined 
keywords just to see your website in the first page of Google, you might want to tweak your 
site’s content.   

Whether you use AdWords or Google.com itself, make sure to take note of the good keywords. 
They will come handy in the next SEO steps. Congratulations, you’ve done “keyword research” 
and you’re well on your way to more “optimized” content.   

Time for Individual Optimization 

People who are led to your website can either be seekers of your specific brand, looking for an 
HVAC company, or are there by chance. Those looking for your particular company do not really 
care about your competition. They want more information about you – what services you offer, 
opening and closing times, shop location, among others. Having a wow website with effective 
SEO will only make this type of visitors loyal. 

Those searching for any HVAC company are not yet decided on which company they will bring 
their business to. They would most probably value a local business that can cater to their needs. 
Since they have not focused on a single company yet, they may compare and do pros and cons 
with each HVAC service provider. If you include long tail keywords that mentions your locale in 
your content, there’s a good chance Google will refer them to you.  Finally, those who visited 
your website by chance may not exactly bring business to you now. 

BUT! If your site gave them a good browsing experience, you may be on top of their minds 
when they will need HVAC services in the future. To capture these three visitor segments, it 
would be best to have target keywords that would appeal to each group. Search engines do not 
index your website as a whole; they index pages individually. So, it is best SEO practice to have 
pages with targeted keywords that will attract those that are looking for you, those with 
keywords that will attract the undecided market, and those with keywords that will make your 
site unforgettable, especially by chance visitors. 

Don’t Forget Content Marketing 

 Don’t forget to also put your keywords and SEO efforts in content marketing. Blogs and 
content-heavy pages still get crawled and indexed by search engine bots, so you still need to 
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produce content that is engaging and useful to your website’s visitors. Visitors may not give you 
business all the time, but they will frequent it once they are engaged to your content. Optimized 
content in your HVAC company blogs is an important part of SEO, so make sure you don’t slack 
off on that aspect 
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