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This privacy policy is provided by Anselme Badour. Anselme Badour will also retain Usage 
Data for internal analysis purposes. Usage Data Hidden Cameras Detector App is generally 
retained for a shorter period of time, except when this data is used to strengthen the 
security or to improve the functionality of our Service, or we are legally obligated to retain 
this data for longer time periods. 
 
Collection and Use of Personal Information 
 
We don't collect personal information including faces or any other personal information. 
It is only used to realize the function of the App itself. Unless the Law forces us, we will not 
share any personal information with any unaffiliated third party for any purpose…ever.  
We will not send promotional emails or special offers, we will not contact you for market 
research, and we will not provide your information to third parties for marketing or 
promotional purposes.  In addition, we will never sell your personal information to any 
unaffiliated third party…ever.   
 
HOW WE PROTECT YOUR INFORMATION 
 
We recognize the importance of protecting the details of users of the Application and 
adopts measures that are intended to protect and safeguard the information that are 
collected from loss or unauthorized access. However, please note that no data security 
measures can guarantee 100% security at all times. Our systems and the communications 
networks through which you access our services may be subject to security breaches and 
failures which are due to circumstances beyond our reasonable control. 
 
A Word about Analytics Services 
 
While using the software and services, certain third parties may enable you to provide 
content to them, in the form of gadgets, buttons, websites, advertising links etc. We 
consider it as third-party contents and services, which are subject to their privacy policies. 
We would not review and guarantee such third-party contents and services. Before you 
using or accessing such third-party contents and services, we recommend that you read 
the terms or conditions of their privacy policies. You shall be aware of using them and 
expressly relieve us from any and all liability arising from your use of such Third Party 
Content and Services. 
 



Cookies 
 
The analytics programs mentioned above use cookies in order to perform their services.  
Cookies are small amounts of data stored on your computer when you browse the Internet, 
which allow your web browser to remember you the next time you visit a given website.  
This helps your web browser deliver you a more tailored experience. For example, cookies 
allow a website to remember your login information, your search history, your user 
preferences on a given website, etc. 
 
It is important to note that cookies are not linked to personal information; no personally 
identifiable information is accessible from our Site. However, you may still opt to set your 
web browser to refuse cookies, or to alert you when cookies are being sent if you so 
choose. 
 
Contact us  
 
If you have any question or comment about this Policy, you can contact us by email: 
badouranselme@gmail.com. 


