
Tab 1 



 

Proposals to address issues 
with GTA/TF pay and 
working conditions at SOAS 
University of London 
  

  

Background 
Through discussion between SOAS fractional teaching staff – Graduate Teaching Assistants 
(GTAs) and Teaching Fellows (TFs) – both formally through University and College Union 
(UCU) workshops and informally between current and past staff, it has become evident that 
there are wide ranging issues with the current state of our pay and working conditions at 
SOAS. In this document we outline some of the key issues and provide specific solutions. We 
hope these proposals can form the basis of fundamental reform to GTA/TF employment at 
SOAS. 
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Overview of proposals  
We find several issues with the current pay and working conditions for fractional teaching staff, which 
we describe in detail in the following sections. To address these serious problems, we make the 
following proposals:  

1.​ Increase the multiplier on teaching hours from +1.5 to +2: SOAS fractional staff are 
significantly underpaid when compared with other London universities (graduate teaching 
assistants at UCL and KCL receive approximately% and 48% higher pay for the same 
work). This is a shameful practice which undervalues the work we do. Increasing the size of 
the multiplier is a step towards addressing this discrepancy. 

2.​ Significantly increase the time allocated for marking assessments: SOAS payments for 
marking assessments fall far behind those of other London universities, with both KCL and 
UCL being paid approximately 2.5 times that of SOAS (per 3000-word script marked). These 
unacceptable marking conditions must end; there must be a significant increase in our pay for 
marking responsibilities via a reduction in the marking rate (scripts/hour). 

3.​ Expand office hours to general support hours and extend the allocation bands: the upper 
band of office hour allocation should be extended to account for the diversity of student 
support we provide and for GTAs/TFs with particularly larger student numbers. This would 
not change the allocation of hours for staff with less than 100 students. 

4.​ Cap the number of students per tutorial/class at 15: the schoolwide determination of class 
sizes is highly inconsistent between departments. Large class sizes create additional unpaid 
work for us and have a negative pedagogical impact on teaching quality. Moving to a 
consistent cap on class sizes across the university can address these issues. 

5.​ Give teachers a right of refusal for over 3 consecutive classes or 4 total classes in a day: 
we are often allocated many consecutive classes with no breaks in between, in some cases 5-6 
classes may be scheduled consecutively. The high intensity of work negatively impacts 
teaching quality. We propose for staff to be informed of their teaching allocation at least a 
month before classes begin, and to be given the right to refuse high intensity working 
conditions. 

6.​ Reform the GTA/TF recruitment process to ensure contracts are received before the 
start of term: there have been massive failures with GTA/TF recruitment this academic year 
2024/25, with most of us expected to work without contracts and many not being paid in the 
October payroll. Sadly, the mess this year is no outlier; it is an annual occurrence. This is a 
deep institutional failure that necessitates fundamental changes to the recruitment process at 
SOAS. These involve starting recruitment for GTAs/TFs much earlier and allocating clear 
owners for the entire process. 

7.​ Move to a Full-time Equivalent (FTE) contract format for all GTAs/TFs: the current 
hourly paid contract causes several issues, particularly for teachers on student visas. This 
form of contract is not standard practice across the higher education sector, with UCL an 
example of a London university that offers FTE contracts to their GTAs/TFs. The change will 
allow teachers to take on additional classes if they desire and make the contracting process 
more straightforward – which supports the previous proposal. 

8.​ Implement mandatory paid inductions for GTAs/TFs: our responsibilities as GTAs/TFs 
are rarely explained to us and this causes deep uncertainty and anxiety. Inconsistency across 
the university means that GTAs/TFs often do not know which responsibilities are ours and 
which belong to the module convenor. In some cases, this leads to deeply exploitative 
workplace relationships. We believe that department-specific inductions, where 
responsibilities are clearly communicated, are necessary to address this. 



 

Detailed proposals 

1. Overall Pay Deal 

Issues 
●​ Disrespectfully low pay relative to other London universities: SOAS pays its fractional 

teachers appallingly little for the work we do relative to other London universities. Using 
contracts given to us by GTAs/TFs at these universities and policies published on the relevant 
institution websites, we have calculated that the standard GTA/TF at KCL is paid a 
staggering 48% more for commensurate work. Relative to UCL things are not much better: 
our peers there are paid 40% more than we are for equivalent work (see accompanying 
“Contract Comparison” document for detailed breakdown of our as methodology and 
calculations for both cases). We demand that this disgraceful, disrespectful pay gap be closed 
immediately. Fractional teachers perform a core part of the work that brings in the student 
fees from which SOAS functions – we demand our fair share of the money we bring in!  

Solutions 
●​ Pay rise: we demand a pay rise to bring our salaries in line with UCL and KCL, equivalent 

London universities. According to our calculation, this will represent a 42% raise for the 
standard GTA/TF (see attached “Contract Comparison” document for calculations). 
Specifically, we propose that the multiplier on teaching hours be increased from +1.5 to +2 
hours per teaching hour (bringing it in line with both KCL and UCL); that the current office 
hours rubric be reformulated as “Student Support” hours to reflect the administrative work we 
do replying to student emails, and extended to reflect massive student numbers and 
corresponding workloads; and that the marking rate (number of scripts/hour) be significantly 
reduced, aligning it with both UCL and KCL (see subsequent sections for a more detailed 
breakdown of these demands). 

●​ Implementation: these changes should be made immediately and implemented from the start 
of Term 2 in January 2025. 

 

 

 

 

 



 

2. Marking pay and working conditions 
While marking is not included in GTA/TF contracts, fractional teachers carry out the bulk of 
assessment marking and are paid according to the following table. 
Assessed Coursework: 
Exam Marking: 

Where the pay is based on the hours worked multiplied by the staff members hourly rate (excluding 
holiday pay). Fractional teachers have major concerns with our pay and working conditions for 
marking, with a group of us carrying out an informal survey in summer 2024 on these issues, which 
received over 30 responses across Departments and Colleges. The results of this survey are 
incorporated within the issues section below. 

Issues 

●​ Extreme underpayment: comparing SOAS marking pay to other London universities shows 
that we are grossly underpaid relative to staff carrying out the same work at other institutions. 
Both UCL and KCL provide an hour's pay for marking a script that falls within the 1500-4000 
band in the table above. This translates to a chasm of around 150% between our pay and 
that of staff at these institutions for the same work. In reality SOAS fractional staff spend 
considerably more time marking than we are paid for, with the marking survey finding that 
none of the respondents thought that the time given per assessment accurately reflected the 
time taken to mark, and over 80% responding that it did not. 

●​ Excessive workload: many of us have especially large marking workloads, in some cases 
well over 100 assessments per term. Because marking takes much longer than is assumed by 
the SOAS marking rate, and the deadlines for this work are very tight, many staff members 
struggle to meet their deadlines, particularly around the winter marking period. Indeed, with 
how long it takes to receive the scripts and mark them, all while allowing enough time for the 
convenor to moderate them, we typically have to devote an enormous part of our schedules to 
marking. This is on top of our other teaching and research responsibilities (note: fractional 
teachers are part-time workers and we are therefore highly likely to have other 
responsibilities). 

●​ Unclear marking responsibilities: because marking is not included in our contracts, there is 
an inconsistent communication of work expectations, with less than half of the respondents to 
our survey saying they knew about marking responsibilities before signing their contract. 
Furthermore, less than half the respondents were aware that marking was not a part of the 
contract they signed and that they were not obliged to mark. 

●​ Student dissatisfaction: SOAS has consistently scored low on questions related to marking, 
assessment and feedback in the National Student Survey (NSS), and this outcome is clearly 
linked to the poor working conditions of fractional staff when it comes to marking. When 
asked how often does feedback help you to improve your work? Only 55.7% and 56.5% of 



 

respondents gave a positive answer in 2023 and 2024 respectively, compared to the 
benchmark values of 68.3% and 68.1%. 

Solutions 

●​ Fair pay for marking: we demand a significant shift in marking pay to address the 
disgraceful gap between SOAS and that of other London universities. We also propose 
increasing the marking boundaries as the current boundaries are large and there is a 
significant difference between a 1500-word essay and a 3500-word essay. Specifically we 
propose amending the hourly pay table for marking as follows: 

Script Length (word 
count) 

Number of scripts paid per 
hour 

Rate per script (plain time 
hours) 

1000 or less 2 0.5 

1001 – 2000 1.5 0.67 

2001 – 3000 1 1 

3001 – 4000 0.75 1.33 

4001 or greater 0.5 2 

Exam Script 1 1 

●​ Extending marking deadlines: we propose that for GTAs/TFs marking over 100 
assessments, an additional two weeks should be allocated for marking, rising to four weeks 
for over 150 assessments. It should be highlighted however that high marking load is directly 
related to departments with large class sizes. Once classes are reduced to a more reasonable 
size, it is likely that far fewer teachers would have over 100 scripts to mark.  

●​ Including marking explicitly in the contract: the way marking is paid causes confusion and 
uncertainty. We recognise it makes the most sense for GTAs/TFs to mark the work of the 
students they teach, and it therefore makes sense for marking to be included explicitly in our 
contracts from the beginning. This will reduce ambiguity and make our marking 
responsibilities clear from the outset. This is conditional, however, on the increase in marking 
pay we have outlined, as under the current pay structure many staff would not b by e able to 
carry out marking responsibilities due to insufficient remuneration for this type of work. 

3. Office hours for high teaching workload 

The current office hours policy for fractional teachers is: 



 

 

Issues 
●​ Upper limit on the band: currently the table stops at 18 office hours. However, in reality, 

many fractional teaching staff teach 150-200 students per term. If a teacher is responsible for 
150 students per term, the calculation is 150*9=1350. Given that there is an increment of 150 
units between bands, if the office hours table extended further, it would assign the staff 
member in this instance 22 plain time (office) hours. For 200 students, it would mean 
200*9=1800, which translates to 28 plain time (office) hours. There is no justification for the 
band having an upper limit, as the increase in the number of students significantly raises the 
corresponding support workload. In fact, fractional teaching staff typically support students 
on- and off-line, way beyond our plain-time (office) hours, leading to unpaid labour.  

●​ Student support outside term time: many students continue to email their GTAs/TFs 
outside of term time, because they are unaware of the fractional nature of our contracts and 
that we are typically not employed by SOAS once term finishes. This often happens after the 
release of assessment marking, and in the exam seasons. Currently, many of us continue to 
respond to our students long after our employment expires out of good will, again, 
undertaking unpaid labour.  

●​ Student dissatisfaction: SOAS has consistently scored low on questions related to contacting 
teaching staff in the National Student Survey (NSS) and this outcome is clearly linked to the 
issues outlined above. When asked ‘how easy was it to contact teaching staff when you 
needed to?’ only 68.4% and 70.6% of respondents gave a positive answer in 2023 and 2024 
respectively, compared to the benchmark values of 84.8% and 86.3%. 



 

Solutions 
●​ Consolidate all student-supporting activities into “Student Support” hours and expand 

the band continuously without an upper limit: we suggest that all types of 
student-supporting activities be consolidated, as there are different types of support that 
students need which cannot be easily delineated into one activity or another. The consolidated 
support hours, along with the extension of employment period with FTE type contract, 
will allow GTAs/TFs to engage more meaningfully with our students and give them the 
support they need outside of term time. We cannot emphasise enough the positive impact this 
will have on student satisfaction at SOAS.   

4. Workload: class sizes and consecutive classes 

Issues 

●​ Excessive class sizes: in several departments at SOAS, it is common for GTAs/TFs to have to 
teach tutorials/seminars with 20-30 students per class, with classes exceeding 30+ students 
in several instances. All first-time fractional teaching staff take mandatory training on 
Preparing to Teach at SOAS with Learning and Teaching Enhancement, which emphasises the 
importance of active learning strategies pivoting on student engagement. It is, however, 
impossible to create a learning environment with student participation and active 
learning when classes are excessively large. We are often so busy with logistical problems, 
such as the room being too crowded, stuffy, and sometimes not even having enough chairs 
and desks to accommodate all our students that we do not have the time to get everyone 
involved in the lesson. Beyond this, it is entirely impractical to expect us to be able to engage 
30 students in a 60-minute class while covering the requisite course material. Students are 
acutely aware of this and the negative impact it has on their learning; many ask us if they can 
switch to another class with fewer students, and many more simply stop attending classes 
after the first week.  

●​ Ambiguous fractional policy: the fractional policy does not provide precise definitions of 
tutorials and seminars. It states that “normally 30-40 students make up a seminar group”, 
which is “normally a discussion-based group”. Whereas a tutorial is defined to be “a 
student-lead [sic] learning activity” that “will normally be up to a maximum of 15 students”. 
These ambiguous definitions create room for the allocation of excessive large classes. 

●​ Consecutive classes: many fractional teaching staff are assigned consecutive classes 
concentrated on one or two days. Often these are booked into different classrooms, or even 
the different buildings. Because teaching more than 2-3 classes consecutively (especially in 
different classrooms) can be extremely exhausting, it can directly harm the quality of 
teaching, creating inconsistencies across classes. 

●​ Rescheduling classes: GTAs/TFs can request timetable changes during the period when the 
provisional timetable is circulated up to around two weeks before the start of the academic 
year. However, the later we make such a request, the more difficult it is to accommodate. 
Currently, College Hubs and Heads of Department (HoDs) typically start the GTA/TF 
recruitment process around June-July, resulting in fractional teachers being hired late, often 
only a week or two before the term starts. Many of us struggle to get a contract and have our 
staff account set up, let alone find the time to check our timetables and request a change to our 
teaching schedules. Even when we do manage to request a change, it is often denied on the 



 

basis that there are not enough classrooms or the requested change clashes with student 
timetables.    

Solutions 
●​ Cap maximum number of students per class at 15: we propose that class sizes be capped at 

15 students per class. This will allow us to create engaging, active learning environments that 
will dramatically improve the student experience at SOAS, which current NSS scores show is 
severely lacking. Practically this will mean that classes for large modules with many students 
will have to be shared between multiple GTAs/TFs, rather than being assigned to just one 
teacher. 

●​ Right of refusal of consecutive classes and excessive workloads: while some GTAs/TFs 
may prefer to have an intensive 1-2 days of work, rather than having it spread out, this very 
much depends on individual circumstances. We therefore demand the right to refuse more 
than 3 consecutive classes and more than 4 total classes in a day. Practically speaking, 
GTAs/TFs should be informed of their teaching allocation at least a month before classes 
start, allowing time for classes to be rescheduled where appropriate. From a pedagogical 
perspective, assigning many classes consecutively, and/or on the same day, without our prior 
agreement directly harms the quality of teaching and student experience at SOAS. Nobody 
should be forced into massive teaching workloads without any consultation. 

5. Working without contracts and underpaying 

Issues 
●​ Getting contracts late: it is unwritten institutionalised practice at SOAS that GTAs and TFs 

are expected to work for several weeks and sometimes months without contracts. This year 
the problem has been particularly acute, as the process of generating contracts has been split 
between College Hubs and HR: the Colleges tell HR how to structure the contracts; HR then 
generates the contracts. It is crucial to emphasise, however, that this mess happens every year 
for most fractional teachers; it is not an isolated issue. It is implicitly understood by most 
HoDs and College administrators that fractional teachers are expected to work without a 
contract for a period on “goodwill”, due to incomplete information on student enrolment 
numbers before the start of the academic year. We cannot state strongly enough that this 
uncertainty causes widespread anxiety amongst fractional teachers. 
These practices would not be acceptable in the vast majority of workplaces in the UK, 
moreover, they are an outlier for the higher education sector in general. For instance, UCL 
offers rolling contracts to GTAs which specify the number of working hours and general 
responsibilities long before the start of the academic year. They subsequently allocate these 
hours to specific modules, classes, and tasks to align with student enrolment that term. This 
example illustrates that the incredibly negligent workplace practices at SOAS are not at all 
necessary, although they are normalised and treated as such. 

●​ Errors in contracts: it is highly unusual for a fractional teacher to receive their contract 
without errors. We typically have to chase College Hubs to correct the faulty information in 
our contracts. Frequently, our emails are ignored, and we can only resolve the issues by 
visiting College offices in person. This places a massive administrative burden on us which 
directs our time and focus away from what we are employed to do – from teaching. Moreover, 
it is common for fractional teachers to have to accept erroneous contracts – which we later 



 

have to correct – just to ensure we are paid on time. Clearly it should not be our responsibility 
to correct contractual errors, errors that should not exist in the first place. 

●​ Late and underpayment of wages: in combination, the previous two points mean that 
fractional teachers are frequently paid late and more often than not incorrectly. Indeed, it is 
institutionalised practice for SOAS to underpay its GTAs and TFs. The burden is placed 
upon us to badger College Hubs and HR into paying us what we are entitled to as per the 
collective bargaining agreement. Sadly, many fractional teachers cannot handle the stress of 
this process and resign themselves to accepting underpayment. 

●​ Lack of communication/human interaction: this problem has come to the fore recently. The 
reorganisation of the GTA/TF recruitment process has placed HR in charge of generating our 
contracts. When we inevitably have an issue, relating to working without a contract or being 
underpaid for our work, we have no mechanism of contacting HR outside of the online 
ticketing portal. Besides being absurdly inefficient, the process of sending messages into a 
black hole and waiting for weeks on end for a reply is exhausting and upsetting. Moreover, 
the specificities of individual contract problems cannot be easily remedied with sporadic 
digital messages. It is normal for a fractional teacher to log a ticket and receive a reply weeks 
later which says their case has been remedied when it has not been at all. The lack of human 
interaction makes the process unnecessarily stressful and inefficient. 

Solutions 
●​ Moving to a “given then updating” contract model: we demand to be given contracts 

before we start working. Practically, this will mean restructuring the recruitment process; 
HoDs and College administrators will have to send recruitment requests for GTAs/TFs to the 
recruitment panel shortly after course/module structures are decided upon by departments 
(traditionally this has been done in February, although we note that SOAS is moving from a 
term to semester structure, so the specific dates are subject to change). We would like to 
emphasise that this is already the practice for hiring new full-time academic staff (who are 
never expected to work on goodwill without contracts) and propose that it be extended to 
recruitment for all GTAs/TFs. Delays at the start of the recruitment process severely disrupt 
our lives and livelihoods once the new academic year begins. 
Whilst we acknowledge that the nature of the higher education industry means that student 
numbers and precise department work schedules are uncertain at the start of term, we totally 
reject the notion that GTAs/TFs should have to work on “goodwill”. It is entirely feasible for 
us to be given contracts before we start working that are subsequently updated to reflect 
complete work schedules as they emerge. Indeed, because the contracts we are issued with 
(late, of course) are typically riddled with errors, we generally have to get them reissued 
through the VT system anyway to avoid being underpaid. We therefore propose that SOAS 
move to a “given then updating” contracting model for GTAs/TFs. 
Goodwill does not pay the bills! – That we need to state this is a damning indictment of 
workplace practices at SOAS. 

●​ Training for College Hubs: clearly several of the administrators in charge of structuring our 
individual contracts do not understand the collective bargaining agreement and SOAS 
fractional staff policies. There is no other explanation for the widespread errors in our 
contracts every year. We propose that College administrators should be given mandatory 
training to ensure they understand the different types of work GTAs/TFs do and the specifics 
of how we should be paid for it. It is deeply concerning and thoroughly unacceptable that 
SOAS makes its teachers work to correct their own contracts when we should be focussing on 



 

teaching and research. We demand that this status quo, the shameful, systematic underpaying 
of GTAs/TFs be rectified immediately. 

●​ Taking ownership of the process: we acknowledge that after the aforesaid solutions are 
implemented, there will still be contractual issues on the margins. To ensure that these can be 
resolved efficiently, without causing distress for the staff members involved, we propose that 
a group of administrators take ownership of the entire GTA/TF recruitment process (across 
College Hubs and HR). Responsibility must be clearly assigned so that we know exactly who 
to go to resolve whatever contractual issues we might have. Moreover, the ticketing portal 
model should be removed from this process. It is a complete failure that creates more work 
for everyone, including HR. Given the complexities with our employment – complex 
work/pay structures, student-visa work-limits, etc. – it is often impossible to resolve our 
specific contractual issues through digital messages. Such problems can only be efficiently 
dealt with in-person. We therefore propose that a process be implemented which allows 
GTAs/TFs on the margins to schedule in-person or online meetings with HR/College Hub 
colleagues to resolve their issues. It cannot be emphasised enough that the implementation of 
these proposals will reduce workloads for everyone. 

6. Work limits for GTAs/TFs on student visas 

Issues 
●​ Arbitrary work-limits imposed on fractional teachers on student visas: fractional teachers 

on student visas are capped at the 20-hour/week limit by the Home Office. At SOAS, this 
typically translates to a limit of 7 or 8 teaching hours per week (8 times 2.5 multiplier equals 
20 hours, before accounting for marking, office hours, etc.), which unfairly restricts 
international workers who want to teach more classes. This is an arbitrary assumption, since 
the various forms of work we do extend well beyond the teaching weeks: we have to 
familiarise ourselves with the content of the classes we teach before terms begins, for which 
we are currently paid under “course prep”; we have to respond to student emails throughout 
the academic year; and, crucially, we mark during the summer term once classes have 
finished. There is no legal or practical reason that our contracts cannot be extended to reflect 
our actual work schedules and thereby allow a greater allocation of teaching hours to those 
who wish to teach more classes.      

●​ Intensified financial pressures: fractional teachers on student visas are typically PhD 
students who pay roughly 4.6 times more in fees than their British colleagues. Moreover, they 
are less likely to receive material support from relatives in the UK. The arbitrary restriction on 
teaching hours thus discriminates against staff members who are often already under 
intensified financial pressures. 

●​ Precluding extra teaching roles at other universities: the calculation for the student visa 
work-limits, as it stands, typically precludes these fractional teachers from taking on 
additional roles at other universities to assuage their personal financial pressures. 

●​ Administrative workload: when a fractional teacher on a student visa wishes to do extra, 
non-GTA/TF work at SOAS, they are responsible for calculating their combined working 
hours to ensure that they do not exceed the visa limit. This creates an administrative burden 
that directs their time away from teaching and research. 

●​ Class sizes: when a fractional teacher on a student visa complains about having overflowing 
classes, they are typically told that they cannot be given extra classes to mitigate this issue 



 

due to their visa work-limits. This creates a two-tiered system based on nationality whereby 
non-British teachers have less flexibility when managing their class sizes. It is a shameful 
example of institutionalised nativism at SOAS. 

●​ Overall discrimination based on nationality: all the previous points clearly demonstrate 
that SOAS unfairly discriminates against its fractional teachers on student visas based upon 
their nationality. This is despite claims in SOAS’s own EDI strategy document that “Equality 
of opportunity is at the core of all the SOAS activities” and promises to “Foreground an 
intersectional approach to EDI at SOAS that is attentive to how inequalities are reproduced 
and sustained at the axis of race, gender, and class” (SOAS EDI 2021-2025, pg. 5, 8). Indeed, 
it is crystal clear that SOAS is in breach of its own EDI policy in relation to fractional 
teachers on student visas.  

Solutions 
●​ Switching to an FTE contract: we demand that SOAS switch to a full-time equivalent (FTE) 

contract structure. It is notable that UCL offers such a contract to their GTAs/TFs, so there is 
no reason whatsoever we cannot be offered the same. Specifically, we propose that teachers 
employed for one semester be given a 5-month contract, and that those working two 
semesters receive a 10-month contract. This will more reasonably reflect the distribution of 
the work we do across the academic year. Crucially, it will allow GTAs/TFs on student visas 
to teach more classes should they wish to. It will rectify the shamefully unjust institutional 
nativism at SOAS vis-à-vis these staff. 

●​ Intersection with class size limits: the implementation of an FTE contract structure will 
allow GTAs/TFs on student visas to pick up some of the slack from the implementation of 
strict, reasonable limits on class sizes at 15 students per class (see proposal 4), and thereby 
contribute to significant pedagogical improvements at SOAS.     

7. Paid mandatory in-person inductions  

Issues 
●​ Lack of instruction about workplace responsibilities: fractional teachers frequently feel 

abandoned when they start working at SOAS. We are seldom told what responsibilities we 
have as employees, how or when we will be paid, and who we can speak to if we have 
workplace issues. This was confirmed in the marking survey we conducted in summer 2024, 
which revealed that fractional teachers feel that they receive inadequate information about 
their workplace responsibilities, and often feel frustrated by the lack of support networks 
within their departments.  

Solutions 
●​ Mandatory paid inductions for all GTAs/TFs: we propose that all GTAs/TFs, both new and 

returning, be paid their basic hourly rate to attend a department specific, in-person induction 
session at the start of every academic year. These sessions should explain workplace standards 
and responsibilities to GTAs/TFs, which change every year with shifting course/module 
structures within departments and university-wide policy updates. It will also give new staff a 
chance to meet their colleagues, helping build genuine academic communities within 
departments. 



 

Making the induction sessions mandatory and paid will strengthen attendance; making them 
in-person will enhance staff engagement.   
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Mini Saxena, PhD Student and GTA in School of Law, ms194@soas.ac.uk  
 
Priyal Chitale, PhD Student in School of Arts, GTA in SLCL, 666532@soas.ac.uk  
 
Taylor Borowetz, doctoral researcher and GTA in the Department of Politics and International 
Studies 
 
Luca Proietti, PhD student and GTA in SLCL, lp41@soas.ac.uk  
 
Lorraine Charbonnier, Teaching Fellow, Department of Politics and International Studies,  
lc4891@soas.ac.uk  
 
Nazam Laila, GTA, Department of Politics and International Studies, nl21@soas.ac.uk. 
 
Panagiotis Gkagkatsis, GTA, Department of Law, pg27@soas.ac.uk  
 
Sophia Demetriou-Jones, Teaching Fellow, School of Law, sd60@soas.ac.uk 
 
Nidah Kaiser, PhD student and GTA, Politics and International Studies, nk52@soas.ac.uk  

Rana Osman, PhD students and GTA, Law, ro16@soas.ac.uk 

Erik Cardona-Gómez, Teaching Fellow, Department of Politics and International Studies, 
ec50@soas.ac.uk 

Tie Franco Brotto, Teaching Fellow, Department of Politics and International Studies, 
tf22@soas.ac.uk  

Victoria Hurr, PhD student and GTA, Art History, School of Arts, vh10@soas.ac.uk 

Florian Wengel, PhD student and GTA in Department of Economics, 705404@soas.ac.uk 

Declan Prout, PhD student and STF in the School of Language, Cultures and Linguistics, 
dp47@soas.ac.uk  

Madiha Noman, Teaching Fellow in Development Studies mn46@soas.ac.uk  

Luigi Monteanni, GTA for Hip Hop Histories and Anthropology Now, PhD student at School 
of Arts, lm68@soas.ac.uk 

Yu Sun, PhD student and GTA in Department of Economics, ys28@soas.ac.uk 

Michael Mutyaba, PhD student and GTA in Department of Politics and International Studies 
mm178@soas.ac.uk  

 

Yuqi Wang, PhD student and GTA in the Department  of Anthropology and Sociology 
yw23@soas.ac.uk 
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Eloisa Romani, PhD student and GTA, Department of Politics and International Studies 
er15@soas.ac.uk  
 
Fatima Rashid, PhD student in Near and Middle East  
645921@soas.ac.uk  
 
Yuying Zhu, PhD student and GTA, Department of Economics 695263@soas.ac.uk 
 
Ana Drulla, PhD student, Department of Economics 725120@soas.ac.uk  
 
Tanvi Kanchan, PhD student, GTA (CoLAP) tk77@soas.ac.uk 
 
S. Seigoulien Haokip, PhD student and GTA in Department of Anthropology and Sociology, 
sh151@soas.ac.uk  
 
Iona Summerson, PhD student and former GTA, Department of Politics and International 
Studies is38@soas.ac.uk  
 
Charlotte Schuitenmaker, PhD student and GTA in School of Arts, cs112@soas.ac.uk 
 
Jennifer Ayoade, PhD student in Department of Politics and International Studies, and GTA 
(CoDEF) 
 
Gaurav Bansal, ex-TF in Department of Development Studies 
 
Daryn Howland, PhD student and former GTA in Department of Development Studies, 
694541@soas.ac.uk 
 
Edoardo Marcarini, PhD student and GTA in the School of Arts, em59@soas.ac.uk 
 
Adria Rius, PhD student in Department of Economics, 645167@soas.ac.uk  
 
Mark Millar, PhD student and GTA in Department of Politics and International Studies, 
mm197@soas.ac.uk 
 
Rohan Preece, PhD student and GTA in Department of Development Studies, 
rp27@soas.ac.uk 
 
Manish Maskara, Senior Teaching Fellow, Development Studies mm169@soas.ac.uk 
 
Alice Lyzcia, PhD student and GTA in Department of Politics and International Studies and 
the Department of History, Religions and Philosophies, al81@soas.ac.uk 
 
Sharowat Shamin, PhD Student and Teaching Fellow in the School of Law, 
ss198@soas.ac.uk ​  
 
Suzana Rahde Gerchmann, Teaching Fellow in the School of Law, sr94@soas.ac.uk 
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Thomas Ebbs, Teaching Fellow in the School of Law, te5@soas.ac.uk 
 
Santosh Anand, Teaching Fellow in the School of Law, sa187@soas.ac.uk 
 
Fanqi Lin, PhD student and Senior Teaching Fellow in Department of Economics, 
fl14@soas.ac.uk 
 
Ali Shams, Teaching Fellow, Department of Politics and International Studies, 
as223@soas.ac.uk 
 
Pu Cheng，PhD student and GTA in Department of Economics, pc71@soas.ac.uk 
 
Raghavi Viswanath, Postdoc and Teaching Fellow in the School of Law, rv13@soas.ac.uk  
 
Zhenzhen Zhang, PhD student and GTA in Department of Economics, zz3@soas.ac.uk  
 
Loveday Liu, Teaching Fellow at the School of Finance and Management, jl134@soas.ac.uk  
 
Ashem Egila , Teaching Fellow at school of Finance and Management ae21@soas.ac.uk 
 
Yamika Ketu, PhD Student and GTA in Department of Economics, yk59@soas.ac.uk  
 
Jael Cortes Rondoy, Teaching Fellow in the Department of Economics and the Department 
of Politics and International Studies, jr67@soas.ac.uk 
 
Tanroop Sandhu, Teaching Fellow in the Department of Politics and International Studies 
 
Anna Löfstrand, PhD Student and GTA in Department of Anthropology and Sociology, 
al82@soas.ac.uk / 696496@soas.ac.uk  
 
Luu Duc Toan Huynh, Teaching Fellow at School of Finance and Management, 
lh47@soas.ac.uk  
 
Xinuo Liang,  PhD Student in the History Department and GTA in the School of Languages, 
Cultures and Linguistics, xl5@soas.ac.uk 
 
Thabo Huntgeburth, PhD student (Economics) and GTA (Development), th58@soas.ac.uk/ 
684568@soas.ac.uk  
 
Sarah Gray, PhD candidate (History) and GTA (Politics), 213887@soas.ac.uk, 
sg101@soas.ac.uk 
Felipe Merlano, Teaching Fellow in the Department of Economics, fm29@soas.ac.uk  
 
Neely Lally, TF in Department of Law, hl61@soas.ac.uk 
 
 
Giada Vercelli, School of Arts, gv4@soas.ac.uk 
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Lena Gempke, PhD Development Economics & GTA, 696261@soas.ac.uk 
 
Mario Arulthas, PhD & GTA, Department of Politics and International Studies 
686827@soas.ac.uk 
 
Dara Salam, TF, Department of Politics and International Studies, ds68@soas.ac.uk  
 
Mike Possapon Charoenporn, PhD & GTA Development Economics & Development Studies 
 
Shruti Nagbhushan Gubbi, PhD and ex-GTA Department of Development Studies 
 
Damon Aitken, PhD Student and GTA in Department of Economics 

Alexis Ehireme Uddin, PhD Student and GTA in Department of Economics 

Yasmine Zarhloule, Teaching Fellow, Department of Politics and International Studies 
yz14@soas.ac.uk  

Mesrob Kassemdjian, Teaching Fellow, Department of Politics and International Studies, 
mk133@soas.ac.uk  

Suraj Nair, PhD student and GTA in Department of Development Studies, sn50@soas.ac.uk  
 
Amrita Shodhan, Sr. Teaching Fellow, HRP as115@soas.ac.uk 
 
George Boss, Lecturer (Teaching) in Political Theory, Department of Politics and 
International Studies, gb52@soas.ac.uk  
 
 
 
Full-time Staff 
 
Grace Mou, Senior Lecturer in the School of Law, ym19@soas.ac.uk 
 
Jonathan Bashi Rudahindwa, Senior Lecturer in the School of Law, jb89@soas.ac.uk  

Abeera Khan, Lecturer in Centre for Gender Studies, ak134@soas.ac.uk  

Sophie Dodsworth, DBA, sd36@soas.ac.uk  

Nicolette Busuttil, Lecturer in the School of Law, nb39@soas.ac.uk  

Kerem Nisancioglu, Senior Lecturer in Department of Politics and International Studies, 
kn18@soas.ac.uk  

Chandni Dwarkasing, Lecturer in Department of Economics, cd34@soas.ac.uk 

Surbhi Kesar, Senior Lecturer, Department of Economics, sk156@soas.ac.uk  

Sara Stevano, Senior Lecturer, Department of Economics, ss129@soas.ac.uk  
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Steve Heder, Staff Research Associate, Department of Politics and International  Studies, 
sh32@soas. 

Yannis Dafermos, Reader, Department of Economics, yd6@soas.ac.uk  

Ashley Thompson, Prof, School of Arts, at50@soas.ac.uk 

Lisa Tilley, Senior Lecturer, Department of Development Studies, LT28@soas.ac.uk 

Thereza Balliester Reis, Lecturer, Department of Economics, tr17@soas.ac.uk 

Neil Robbie EAP Lead, LTE nr2@soas.ac.uk 

Vino Kanapathipillai, Senior Lecturer in Department of Politics and International Studies, 
vk2@soas.ac.uk 

Marcus Gilroy-Ware, Lecturer in Creative Digital Media, School of Arts, mg98@soas.ac.uk 

Stephen Murphy, Senior Lecturer, School of Arts, sm120@soas.ac.uk  

Owen Miller, Lecturer in Korean Studies, School of Languages, Cultures and Linguistics, 
om4@soas.ac.uk 

Catriona Drew, SOAS Law, cd4@soas.ac.uk 

Nathaniel George, Lecturer in Politics of the Middle East, Department of Politics and 
International Studies,  ng33@soas.ac.uk 

Tim Pringle, Development Studies. tp21@soas.ac.uk 

Alice Rudge, Lecturer in Anthropology ar80@soas.ac.uk 

Safia Aminah Shaikh, SOAS SU ss212@soas.ac.uk 

Lars Laamann, Senior Lecturer in History LL10@soas.ac.uk  

Andrea Janku, Senior Lecturer in History aj7@soas.ac.uk  

Anna Lindley, Reader, Department of Development Studies al29@soas.ac.uk  

Grietje (River) Baars, Reader in Law & Social Change gb54@soas.ac.uk  

Parvathi Menon, Lecturer in Law pm55@soas.ac.uk  

Alexej Ulbricht, Senior Lecturer in Political Theory, Department of Politics and International 
Studies, au6@soas.ac.uk    

Anandi Rao, Lecturer in South Asian Studies, SLCL, ar75@soas.ac.uk  

Alvina Hoffmann, Lecturer in Diplomatic Studies, Department of Politics and International 
Studies, ah149@soas.ac.uk  

Mark Laffey, Senior Lecturer in International Relations, Department of Politics and 
International Studies, ml23@soas.ac.uk 
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Andrew Newsham, Senior Lecturer in International Development, Department of 
Development Studies, an14@soas.ac.uk ​  

 

 

Undergraduates 
 
Hanan Mohamed, BA Global Development and Law, 719077@soas.ac.uk  
 
Maryam Jilani, BA International Relations and Arabic 688075@soas.ac.uk 
 
Hannah Smith, BA International Relations and Arabic 679701@soas.ac.uk 
 
Luc Cadwaladr-Evans, BA International Relations and Languages and Cultures, 
706608@soas.ac.uk  
 
Lileth Chinn, BA Global Development, 701285@soas.ac.uk 
 
Brayan Kacorri, BSc Economics, 715073@soas.ac.uk 
 
Shloka Murarka, BSc Economics, 690234@soas.ac.uk 
 
Nadira Tasneem Uddin, BA Economics, 698623@soas.ac.uk   
 
Rhea Rankin, BA International relations and Global development 715037@soas.ac.uk 
 
Mahnoor Choudhury BA Economics and Global Development 716818@soas.ac.uk 
 
Maryam Ahmed, Development Economics, 715108@soas.ac.uk  
 
Alfie Bridges Smith, BA Global Development. 
 
Daniel Noon, BA History, 710197@soas.ac.uk 
 
Sarah Cotte, BSc PPE, 697113@soas.ac.uk  
 
David Gran, BSc PPE, 701796@soas.ac.uk 
 
Milena Sebhatu, BA Global Development, 699360@soas.ac.uk 
 
Govind Shah, BA Economics and Social Anthropology, 696704@soas.ac.uk 
 
Juhi Yadav, Bsc Economics, 720271@soas.ac.uk  
 
Aneesa Khan, BSc Economics, 698150@soas.ac.uk 
 
James Jenkins, BA Social Anthropology and History, 719072@soas.ac.uk  
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Alex Evans, BSc Politics, Philosophy, and Economics, 724786@soas.ac.uk  
 
Kaliea micoli, BA economics 718423@soas.ac.uk 
 
Nazifa Miah , Bsc economics 724879@soas.ac.uk 
 
Alex Ciortea, BSc Accounting and Finance 708223@soas.ac.uk 
 
Lana Nott, BA Economics and Japanese 717747@soas.ac.uk  
 
Zaynab Sultana, BA Economics, 720971@soas.ac.uk  
 
Najifa Tasnim, BSc Accounting and Finance, 718732@soas.ac.uk 
 
Ana Riojas Conde, BA Economics, 717446@soas.ac.uk  
 
Davis-Aladren, Bsc PPE, 717462@soas.ac.uk  
 
Joanne Smith, BSc Economics, 703299@soas.ac.uk 
 
Savan Patel, BSc Economics, 700070@soas.ac.uk 
 
Tafweeq Azim, Bsc Economics 710101@soas.ac.uk 
 
Hannah Wood BA Russian and Arabic 725484@soas.ac.uk 
 
Tom Hasler, BSc Development Economics, 678079@soas.ac.uk 
 
Naa’ilah Aswat, BA Social Anthropology and Language & Culture, 716551@soas.ac.uk 
 
Emilie De Maerschalck, BSc PPE, 720225@soas.ac.uk   
 
Sami Hussain Bsc accounting and finance, 718994@soas.ac.uk 
 
Afsha Tufail, BA Global development and Economics, 705062@soas.ac.uk 
 
Safeen Miah BA Economics, 708433@soas.ac.uk 
 
Haile-Idris BA Economics and Politics 705345 
 
deniz economics BSc 707263@soas.ac.uk 
 
Jakub Gromczak BA Economics 706222 706222@soas.ac.uk  
 
Neelja Maleku BA Economics 708423@soas.ac.uk  
 
Sara Parsa BSc Economics 707397@soas.ac.uk708423@soas.ac.uk 
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Zubeir Ahmed Bsc Economics 690494@soas.ac.uk 
 
Ailian Pei BA Japanese and Economics 688838@soas.ac.uk 
 
Finn Livingstone Bsc Development Economics 701856@soas.ac.uk 
 
Iona Campbell BSc Development Economics 710099@soas.ac.uk 
 
Minahil Nadeem - BSc Development Economics, 697591@soas.ac.uk 
 
Firdous Cassim - BSc Economics, 699792@soas.ac.uk  
 
Layla Sadek - BA Economics and Politics, 699383@soas.ac.uk 
 
Zakiyah Khatun, Bsc Economics - 706246@soas.ac.uk 

Faisal Abdul, Bsc Development Economics - 712510@soas.ac.uk 

Moosa Miah, BSc Economics, 706514@soas.ac.uk 
 
Fazle Baksh, BSc Economics, 708028@soas.ac.uk 

Mohammed Khan, BsC Economics 707875@soas.ac.uk 

Filip Śpiewak, BA Economics and History, @707971@soas.ac.uk 

Amir Sayyid, BSc Economics 706525@soas.ac.uk 

Muna Mohamed, BA Economics and Politics, 668127@soas.ac.uk  

Daud Haroon, BSc Economics-707282@soas.ac.uk 

Moses Ayodeji, Bsc Economics 712470@soas.ac.uk 

Martina Quinzo, BA Economics and Chinese 707324@soas.ac.uk  

Taaha Mujadidy, BSc Economics - 712227@soas.ac.uk 

Alla Hamid, BA Economics- 700803@soas.ac.uk 

Amira Allouache BSc Economics 718881@soas.ac.uk 

Hrishi Jones BA Arabic and International Relations 

Lisa Mazillier BA Social Anthropology and International Relations 700591@soas.ac.uk  

Ines Bega BA Economics and Law 691319@soas.ac.uk  

Matthew McMahon BSC Politics, Philosophy and Economics 706717@soas.ac.uk 

Arthur Searle, BSc Politics, Philosophy and Economics 708677@soas.ac.uk 
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Edward frost, BSc Politics, Philosophy and Economics 708618@soas.ac.uk 

Naomi Bahru, BA Social Anthropology 714965@soas.ac.uk 

Panha Ros, Bsc Economics 710440@soas.ac.uk   

Harry Harford, BA International Relations, 710073@soas.ac.uk 

Eesa Ali BA  Arabic and Economics 707821@soas.ac.uk 

Paula Ofosu-Asare LLB Law: 710417@soas.ac.uk 

Melina Tavakoli Moghaddam, BA Politics and International Relations, 714885@soas.ac.uk 

Victoria Mehta, BA Politics and International Relations, 706040@soas.ac.uk  

Lily Allen, BA Politics and International Relations, 709660@soas.ac.uk  

Sofia Bellinello, BA Global Development and Languages and Cultures, 719812@soas.ac.uk  

Mara Elena Hornemann, BA Politics and International Relations, 701670@soas.ac.uk  

Sam Curtis Gravesen, BA International Relations and Arabic, 690732@soas.ac.uk  

Sofiia Yermak, BA International Relations, 709968@soas.ac.uk 

Szara Sharif, BA International Relations and Arabic, 695464@soas.ac.uk 

Anna Hamerow BA International Relations 

Kiyana Nahvi, BA Politics and International Relations, 706477@soas.ac.uk 

Marina Pavlova BA Politics 722327@soas.ac.uk  

Lizi Nzuki, BA International Relations and History 709464@soas.ac.uk 

Anike Aliu, BA Politics and International Relations 707579@soas.ac.uk  

Red Beswick, BA  Arabic and international relations 707364@soas.ac.uk 

Sarah Place, BA International Relations and Global Development, 720444@soas.ac.uk 

Amal Mohamed, BA Politics and International Relations, 716881@soas.ac.uk  

Xochitl Tai-Dawson, BA International Relations and Global Development, 
716473@soas.ac.uk  

Camilla Taylor, BA International Relations, 724794@soas.ac.uk  

Khadijah Sheikh , BA Global Development and Economics 706836@soas.ac.uk  

Ryan Attout, BSc Economics 709570@soas.ac.uk 

Elisabeth Rose Osborne, BA Korean and History of Art, 691201@soas.ac.uk  

Lisa Paris, BA Japanese, 692269@soas.ac.uk 
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Clare Sitei, BA Korean, 684875@soas.ac.uk  

Tara Mann, BA Politics and International Relations, 700495@soas.ac.uk  

Phoebe Dadswell, BA East Asian Studies and History 698175@soas.ac.uk 

Sienna Brodie-Gold 687914@soas.ac.uk BA international relations and Korean  

Alex Bond, BA East Asian Studies, 700283@soas.ac.uk  

Anna Boglarka Kiss, BA Korean, 690574@soas.ac.uk  

Germa Tsion, BA Social Anthropology and Africa and Black Diaspora, 712422@soas.ac.uk  

Amelia Casey-Rerhaye, BA Arabic, 681085@soas.ac.uk  

Jacob Winter, BA Politics and International Relations, 698942@soas.ac.uk 

Matthew O’Regan, BA Global Liberal Arts, 715933@soas.ac.uk  

Emma Smith, BA Social Anthropology, 708492@soas.ac.uk 

Anisah Mahamoud, BA International Relations, 688334@soas.ac.uk 

Barty Roberts, BA Politics and International Relations, 705149@soas.ac.uk  

Sam Hardy, BA Chinese, 670347@soas.ac.uk 
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