
**Privacy Policy for Antischool Words** 
 
Last Updated: May 17, 2023 
 
This Privacy Policy describes how your personal information is collected, used, and shared 
when you use the Antischool Words mobile application (the "App"). 
 
**1. Personal Information We Collect** 
 
When you use our App, we automatically collect certain information about your device, including 
information about your web browser, IP address, time zone, and some of the cookies that are 
installed on your device. Additionally, as you use the App, we collect information about the 
individual web pages or products that you view, what websites or search terms referred you to 
the App, and information about how you interact with the App. We refer to this 
automatically-collected information as “Device Information.” 
 
We collect Device Information using the following technologies: 
 
- “Log files” track actions occurring on the App, and collect data including your IP address, 
browser type, Internet service provider, referring/exit pages, and date/time stamps. 
 
- “Web beacons,” “tags,” and “pixels” are electronic files used to record information about how 
you browse the App. 
 
Furthermore, when you sign up or attempt to sign up through the App, we collect certain 
information from you, including your name, email address, and password. We refer to this 
information as “Account Information.” 
 
When we talk about “Personal Information” in this Privacy Policy, we are talking both about 
Device Information and Account Information. 
 
**2. How Do We Use Your Personal Information?** 
 
We use the Account Information that we collect generally to provide you with access to and use 
of the App and its features. Additionally, we use this Account Information to: 
 
- Communicate with you; 
- Provide you with information or advertising relating to our products or services. 
 
We use the Device Information that we collect to help us improve and optimize our App (for 
example, by generating analytics about how our customers browse and interact with the App, 
and to assess the success of our marketing and advertising campaigns). 
 
**3. Sharing Your Personal Information** 



 
We do not share your Personal Information with third parties. We respect your privacy and 
understand the importance of the information you entrust to us.  
 
**4. Your Rights** 
 
If you are a European resident, you have the right to access personal information we hold about 
you and to ask that your personal information be corrected, updated, or deleted. If you would 
like to exercise this right, please contact us through the contact information below. 
 
**5. Changes** 
 
We may update this privacy policy from time to time in order to reflect, for example, changes to 
our practices or for other operational, legal, or regulatory reasons. 
 
**6. Contact Us** 
 
For more information about our privacy practices, if you have questions, or if you would like to 
make a complaint, please contact us by email at goeng@ukr.net. 
 
**7. Consent** 
 
By using our App, you hereby consent to our Privacy Policy and agree to its terms. 
 
**8. Data Security** 
 
Your Account Information is stored only for authentication purposes. We adopt appropriate data 
collection, storage, and processing practices and security measures to protect against 
unauthorized access, alteration, disclosure or destruction of your personal information stored on 
our App. 
 


