
 

Gifted and Talented Art Rubric (Grades 8–12)​ VISUAL ART  2024–25 
 

          Student Name _________________________​ Grade _____   Date _____________ 
 

Portfolio 
Exceptional 

4 Points Each 
Outstanding 

3 Points Each 
Above Average 
2 Points Each 

Average 
1 Point Each 

Elements of Art 
and Principles 
of Design  

☐ Artwork shows 
exceptional application of 
design 

☐ Artwork shows effective 
application of the rules of 
design  

☐ Artwork shows satisfactory 
use of the basic rules of design 

☐ Artwork shows minimal 
evidence of understanding 
basic rules of design 

Creativity and 
Originality  

☐ Artwork shows 
inventive adaptation and 
assimilation of complex 
themes 

☐ Artwork shows logical 
adaptation and assimilation 
of common themes  

☐ Artwork shows adequate 
adaptation to common themes 

☐ Artwork shows minimal or 
emerging  evidence of 
original thought 

Skills ☐ Artwork shows 
innovative attention to and 
remarkable use of 
techniques 

☐ Artwork shows developed 
attention to and effective use 
of techniques  

☐ Artwork shows acceptable 
attention to formal techniques  

☐ Artwork shows emerging 
demonstration & 
understanding of techniques 
of the chosen medium 

Craftsmanship  ☐ Artwork shows precise 
attention to quality and 
presentation of materials  

☐ Artwork shows 
convincing attention to 
quality and presentation of 
materials  

☐ Artwork shows adequate 
attention to the quality and 
presentation of materials 

☐ Artwork shows 
developing quality and 
presentation of materials 

Art Assignment 
 

Elements of Art 
and Principles 
of Design  

☐ Artwork shows 
exceptional application of 
design  

☐ Artwork shows effective 
application of the rules of 
design  

☐ Artwork shows satisfactory 
use of the basic rules of design 

☐ Artwork shows minimal 
evidence of understanding 
basic rules of design 

Creativity and 
Originality  

☐ Artwork shows 
inventive adaptation and 
assimilation of complex 
themes 

☐ Artwork shows logical 
adaptation and assimilation 
of common themes  

☐ Artwork shows adequate 
adaptation to common themes 

☐ Artwork shows minimal or 
emerging  evidence of 
original thought 

Skills ☐ Artwork shows 
innovative attention to and 
remarkable use of 
techniques 

☐ Artwork shows developed 
attention to and effective use 
of techniques  

☐ Artwork shows acceptable 
attention to formal techniques  

☐ Artwork shows emerging 
demonstration & 
understanding of techniques 
of the chosen medium 

Craftsmanship  ☐ Artwork shows precise 
attention to quality and 
presentation of materials  

☐ Artwork shows 
convincing attention to 
quality and presentation of 
materials  

☐ Artwork shows adequate 
attention to the quality and 
presentation of materials 

☐ Artwork shows 
developing quality and 
presentation of materials 

On-Demand 
 

Elements of Art 
and Principles 
of Design  

☐ Artwork shows 
exceptional application of 
design  

☐ Artwork shows effective 
application of the rules of 
design  

☐ Artwork shows satisfactory 
use of the basic rules of design 

☐ Artwork shows minimal 
evidence of understanding 
basic rules of design 

Creativity and 
Originality  

☐ Artwork shows 
inventive adaptation and 
assimilation of complex 
themes 

☐ Artwork shows logical 
adaptation and assimilation 
of common themes  

☐ Artwork shows adequate 
adaptation to common themes 

☐ Artwork shows minimal or 
emerging  evidence of 
original thought 

Skills ☐ Artwork shows 
innovative attention to and 
remarkable use of 
techniques 

☐ Artwork shows developed 
attention to and effective use 
of techniques  

☐ Artwork shows acceptable 
attention to formal techniques  

☐ Artwork shows emerging 
demonstration & 
understanding of techniques 
of the chosen medium 

Craftsmanship  ☐ Artwork shows precise 
attention to quality and 
presentation of materials  

☐ Artwork shows 
convincing attention to 
quality and presentation of 
materials  

☐ Artwork shows adequate 
attention to the quality and 
presentation of materials 

☐ Artwork shows 
developing quality and 
presentation of materials 

 Total:  Total: Total: Total: 
 

 
FINAL TOTAL: ______/48 

 


