
WHITEY OKLAHOMA TOUR #1 
2-3-20 thru 2-9-20 

Guymon,Oklahoma City,Tulsa 
 
Good evening everyone, this week I had the pleasure of touring the great state of Oklahoma. I 
toured three beautiful cities and overall I met a lot of new friends and have learned about what 
the people of Oklahoma want in a candidate. I will cherish my time spent here with the average 
man and women of the great state of Oklahoma! 
 
I arrived first on Monday around 11 AM in Guymon and immediately went to a fish fry for lunch 
that was being funded by a very nice church, i had some very tasty fish and chatted with one 
man in particular named Jason, this was a guy in his mid 20’s who told me firsthand that he 
doesn’t vote anymore due to his distrust in government. He said his top issues were the Second 
Amendment,Infrastructure and the Economy. I explained to him my Pro-Gun stances, my stance 
to rebuild Dixie and my Pro-Growth policies. Jason then told me that he liked those ideas and 
said he will do some more research on me before determining if I was a good candidate.  
 
I then mingled around, speaking to everyone there and learning about the person in the 
process, around 1 PM the event was wrapping up and i saw the event hosts and went up and 
thanked them for having the fish fry. The church preacher then showed me around this beautiful 
church and informed me that this church is an active community event holder and has seen 
thousands of people here at this church. I praised them and the work they do. Before I left, we 
said a prayer and the preacher handed me a miniature bible. I gladly took it and put it on my 
tour bus. 
 
Later on in the afternoon, I stopped by a gunshow in Guymon and met some pretty awesome 
gun enthusiasts. We talked about the different types of pistols like the .357 Magnum,10mm,.40 
S&W among many others. I also talked to them about other guns like the 30-06,.270,12 
gauge,etc. We exchanged some pretty well formed gun knowledge and i think i left there having 
made a good impression. 
 
On Tuesday i had a luncheon with some Pro-Gun groups and we talked all about the laws and i 
explained to them i was a staunch Second Admendment supporter. One of the Pro-Gun groups 
invited me out to a shooting range where i once again met some more citizens of Guymon and 
once again exchanged our ideas and i shared my knowledge of guns. Much to my surprise, I 
was a pretty good shot with the 30-06, one of my favorite rifles. We spent some hours shooting 
and busting off rounds of ammunition. I felt like I created a bond with the town of Guymon and 
when leaving the gun range I was met with a lot of pats on the back and high fives, even though 
it may have not been a whole lot of people there, I felt like I had earned the respect of some in 
Guymon. 
 
On Wednesday, I made it into Oklahoma City and first met with a Fiscal Conservative group and 
we had a nice talk on ways to balance the budget,improve funding for certain things and enact a 
pro-growth economy. I told them I overwhelmingly stressed to them I share the same values 
they do and we also had some great dialogue. They invited me to a meeting of some business 
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owners in Oklahoma and I went, I met with many businesses big and small but this one 
business owner stood out to me, his name was Steven and he owned a small mechanic shop, 
he informed me that due to the over regulation and taxation, his savings are bleeding dry and 
that he has forced to cut hours and may soon have to fire staff. I told Steven I was behind him 
all the way and that I will free the chains from our great business all across Dixie. 
 
On Thursday, I met with an infrastructure group and we had a nice meeting in i learned about 
some of the regulations and things associated with needing to build or repair our infrastructure, i 
understood the frustrations and said that I am committed to rebuilding Dixie and that includes 
things like roads,bridges,buildings,power stations and much more. I told them that with a good 
and clear infrastructure plan we can build to our hearts desire and at the same time get it done 
the quickest and with the lowest cost. The meeting was productive and I left there with vast 
amounts of new knowledge. 
 
Friday, I went to Tulsa and first went to some local diners and met some awesome patrons and 
ran into some law enforcement officers and gladly sat there and talked to them. Many of them 
were tired of the amti-police narrative being spewed out by some politicians and others. I told 
them I would be a staunch supporter of law enforcement. Later that day, I toured the Tulsa 
police department headquarters and met many great officers and staff at the headquarters. I 
also enjoyed the hot donuts the officers had made for me. While there, I sat down with some top 
Tulsa officers and we discussed crime and how to reduce some categories of crime. They gave 
me some suggestions and methods that they have been thinking of implementing. I gladly took 
the advice and on the way out shook any officers hand i could see in sight. 
 
On Saturday, I coordinated with my future tour schedule and made a call to the special guest i 
will be having and is taking the time out of their busy schedule to come down to Dixie and meet 
the great citizens of Dixie. We discussed many of our ideas and many of our common goals. We 
set out a game plan and how we will approach the visit next week to ensure it is a great 
experience for all. 
 
On Sunday, I read the bible I got from the preacher the prior Monday. It was an easy and 
relaxed day and well deserved. I had to take a rest day as they say and also catch up on 
anything I had missed from the prior week. 


