
Hatchet Choice Board  

One Choice = One 3D Printing Project with Mrs. Carney 
Ideas: Google Slide/Doc, Video (edited), Poster, StoryBoardThat, Website, Other.  Be Creative!  

 

Write a newspaper 
article that objectively 
describes Brian’s ordeal 

and rescue.   
 
 
 
 
 
 

Write 1+ page 
 

Create a 3X3 comic strip 
including 3 important 
events from Hatchet.  

Make sure to include both 
dialogue and thoughts of 

the characters.    
 

Idea:  StoryboardThat.com 

Research plane crash 
survivors like Brian that 
were able to survive 

after the crash.  Look 
for patterns in their 

survival.  Are there other 
interesting details you want 

to share?   
 

Write 1+ page 2+ sources 

Pretend that you are 
Brian and you are 

keeping a journal about 
your thoughts and 

experiences in the forest.  
Write a series of at 

least ten journal entries. 
 

Write 2+ pages 

 

Write a ten question test 
for Hatchet.  Include 4 
multiple choice, 2 essay, 
and 4 questions of your 
choice.  You MUST 
answer each question. 

Time to be creative!  
Write a poem or song 

written by Brian about his 
time in the forest! Focus 
on some of the repeated 
words from the book for 
inspiration.  Add details 

about what Brian is going 
through. 

 
Write 1+ page 

Author Paulson uses 
specific words to convey 
emotion throughout the 
book.  Choose TEN 

important phrases, quotes, 
or passages from the 
book.  For each one 

write about the author’s 
craft and meaning.  How 
do these words impact the 
story, what application do 
the words have for the 

reader?  

Pack a bag for Brian.  
What are ten things you 
would pack for Brian?  
Tell what each item is 

and tell how he would use 
it.  Everythign must fit 
into a small backpack, so 
you can’t bring too much.  
Also remember that he is 
in the wildness- so a cell 
phone would be useless.  
Don’t forget to leave room 

for the Hatchet! 



 


