
Terms of Use 
This application is developed by  Jarraar Baqi . By downloading this app from 
the Apple App Store, including any updates or enhancements, you agree to 
comply with these Terms of Use. All rights not explicitly granted herein are 
reserved by the licensor. 

LICENSE SCOPE 

You are granted a non-exclusive, non-transferable, and non-sublicensable 
license to install and use the app on any Apple-branded device you own or 
control, in accordance with Apple’s Usage Rules and the App Store Terms of 
Service. This license also covers usage by accounts linked via Family Sharing 
or volume purchase programs. 

The licensor reserves the right to update or modify the licensing terms at any 
time. 

These terms do not override any applicable third-party terms. You are 
responsible for ensuring compliance with all relevant third-party agreements 
when using the application. 

DATA USAGE 

By using the application, you acknowledge and agree that the licensor may 
access and adjust downloaded content and personal data in accordance with 
the [Privacy Policy]. 

USER CONTRIBUTIONS 

Any content, feedback, or suggestions you submit may be stored, processed, 
and used by the licensor in accordance with the [Privacy Policy] and your 
selected preferences. 

By submitting feedback, you grant the licensor a royalty-free, perpetual, and 
non-exclusive license to use, reproduce, and share it, without compensation. 
However, you retain ownership of your intellectual property. 

You are solely responsible for your submissions. The licensor assumes no 
liability for the content you contribute. 

TERMINATION 

This license is effective until terminated by either party. It will automatically 
terminate without notice if you violate any of the terms. Upon termination, you 
must discontinue use and delete all copies of the application from your 
devices. 



 

INTELLECTUAL PROPERTY CLAIMS 

If a third party claims that your use of the application infringes on their 
intellectual property rights, the licensor will be solely responsible for 
investigating, defending, resolving, or settling such claims. 

 

REFUND DATA SHARING 

To process refund requests for in-app purchases, anonymized data may be 
shared with Apple. This may include: 

Time since installation, 

Total app usage duration, 

Anonymous user identifiers, 

Total amount spent and refunded. 

No personally identifiable information is collected or shared during this 
process. 

 

Contact Us 

If you have any further questions about these Terms of Use, please feel free to 
get in touch: 

Email: jarraarbaqi@icloud.com 
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