
SL: To win get their eye 
 
Hey, name, I understand you are busy, but there’s something I believe could be powerful for 
your business I wanted to share… 
 
The difficulties you face in your niche. Like trying your best to reach a wider audience, 
building trust with potential clients, and creating high-quality, effective courses.  
 
But lack of free time is a big problem. As you have to create helpful courses and handle the 
sharing with-people process too. It can be exhausting 
 
Imagine waking up and being able to devote your time to mindfully creating your next 
course or video. Without worrying about the time-consuming task of reaching potential 
clients.  
 
How is it possible? You know, there is one strategy to help you achieve this state. "Get Their 
Eye To Win" is a unique solution for Facebook Ads. It makes your course visible to your 
target audience and captures their attention, which can be challenging in today's fast-paced 
world with low attention spans. 
 
I have examples for you to test and see the results in your bank account. 
 
If you're interested in learning more about the 'Get Their Eye To Win' strategy and seeing 
some examples of how it can work for your business. I'd be happy to send them over. Let 
me know if that's something you'd like, and I'll make sure you have all the information you 
need. 
 
Best regard, 
Daniel Mykhayliv 
 
 

Follow-up 1: 

Subject: “Get Their Eye To Win” 

Hi Jane, 

I hope this email finds you well. I just wanted to check in and see if you had a chance to 
review the information I sent over about "Get Their Eye To Win." I understand that you may 
be busy, but I wanted to offer my assistance and answer any questions you may have. 



If you're still interested, I'd be happy to provide additional information and resources that 
could help you get started. 

Best regards,  

Daniel Mykhayliv 

Follow-up 2: 

Subject: Short Reminder 

Hi Jane, 

I just wanted to reach out and see if there's anything I can do to help you make a decision 
about "Get Their Eye To Win." I understand that you may have a lot on your plate, but I 
believe that this solution could make a big difference in your course promotions. 

If you have any questions or concerns, please don't hesitate to reach out. I'm here to help in 
any way I can. 

Best regards,  

Daniel Mykhayliv 

Follow-up 3: 

Subject: The Last Thing… 

Hi Jane, 

This is my final follow-up regarding "Get Their Eye To Win." I wanted to let you know that 
this is a limited-time opportunity, and I don't want you to miss out on the benefits that this 
solution can provide. 

If you're still interested, I would be happy to schedule a call to go over the details and 
answer any questions you may have. Otherwise, I understand and will not contact you 
again. 

Best regards,  

Daniel Mykhayliv 

 


