
Reading the World Tasks and Resources 
for April 8. 
 
 
Log on: 
User name:  ​ins210 
Password:​ alverno15 
 
Go to blogger.com 
User name:​ alvernoreadingtheworld2 
Password:​ girlsacademy2016 
 
Open my blog for today’s tasks and 
resources. 
 
Check out responses to your movie review 
blog from last month. 



If you want to make your own gifs, go to 
Make a Gif.  Follow the instructions via the 
Youtube Option.  
 
If you want to make another survey, go to 
Poll-Maker.  Remember to copy the HTML 
code.  When you are in a new post, switch 
“compose” to HTML, paste. 
 
If you want to make Glitter Text, go to Glitter 
Text.  You capture the code and paste it in a 
blog just like the polls. 
 
If you want to add animated gifs, go to 
Amazing Animations.  You right-click the 
ones you want, and save as a gif.  These 

http://makeagif.com/
http://makeagif.com/
http://www.poll-maker.com/
http://www.poll-maker.com/
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are then inserted into a blogpost like a 
picture. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Review and Reading Living Out 
 

Review Act 1; Read Act 2, Scenes 1-3 

 
Discussion of INTERPRETATION 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



Timed Writing: Analyzing conflict 
​  
Write a well-developed short essay about 
what you think is the central conflict in 
Living Out. Some questions to consider are: 
What evidence is there of the conflict? Who 
is involved with that conflict?  What do you 
learn about the characters from how the 
respond to the conflict? How realistic or 
relevant is the conflict?  Can personally 
relate to one or more of the characters and 
their perspective in the conflict?  
 
 
 
 
 


