
Financial assistance programs for pet parents experiencing financial hardship       

Please read through each website to determine 
eligibility. Funding situations may change.  

 

 

 

Emergency     
Pets of the Homeless 
https://petsofthehomeless.org/get-help/ 
Case managers are available to take new cases M-F 
9am – 3pm PST. If your pet experiences illness or 
injury, please call us. 775-841-7463. 
                                  
Doctor Steve  
https://doctorsteve.org/ 
Founded to eliminate economic euthanasia, apply 
online to be considered for care for your pet.  
 
Bow Wow Buddies 
https://www.bowwowbuddies.com/apply-for-grant/ 
Can help cover medical treatment for certain serious 
conditions and emergency services 
 
Frankie’s Friends 
https://www.frankiesfriends.org/national-frankies-fri
ends-fund 
Frankie’s Friends Fund provides financial assistance 
grants to family owned pets in need of lifesaving 
emergency or specialty veterinary care whose 
caregivers cannot afford the full cost of treatment 
 
Pet Assistance Inc. 
https://www.petassistanceinc.org/financialaid 
Funds urgent and emergency care. Will not work 
with veterinary clinic chains such as VCA etc.  
 
Red Rover Relief Fund 
https://redrover.org/relief/ 
Urgent care grants for lifesaving care. 
Domestic Violence escape support. 
 
Lexi’s Legacy 
https://www.lexis-legacy.org/grant-application 
Helps with Urgent care and Emergency situations. 
 
Harley’s Hope Foundation 
https://www.harleys-hopefoundation.org/get-help/ 
Works in CO only.  
 

Sick/Urgent Pets 
Bow Wow Buddies 
https://www.bowwowbuddies.com/apply-for-grant/ 

Can help cover medical treatment for certain serious 
conditions and emergency services 
 
Lexi’s Legacy 
https://www.lexis-legacy.org/grant-application 
Helps with Urgent care and Emergency situations 
 
Pet Assistance Inc. 
https://www.petassistanceinc.org/financialaid 
Funds urgent and emergency care 
 
Help a Pet 
https://www.help-a-pet.org/apply.html 
Helps owners who cannot afford veterinary services, 
medicine, or medical supplies for a sick or injured 
pet. Not very specific on what is covered.  
 
For the Love of Alex 
https://www.fortheloveofalex.org/help-my-pet 
Helps support urgent care.  
 
Compassion Animal Project 
https://www.compassionanimalproject.org/apply-for
-help 
Does your pet need emergency, critical care, and/or 
specialized veterinary care? If so, your pet may be a 
candidate for a grant.   
 
The Mosby Foundation 
https://www.themosbyfoundation.org/ 
Financial support for urgent care/sick pets.  
 
Hope Mending Hearts 
http://www.hopemendinghearts.net/grant-process/ 
Grants typically $100-$200 for urgent care 
 
Brown Dog Foundation  
https://www.browndogfoundation.org/ask-for-help#
APPLYFORASSISTANCE 
Not a lot of info on what they can cover, but the 
application allows you to enter urgent care or spay 
neuter requests.  
 
Oscar Newman 
https://oscarnewman.com/pages/violets-friends-app
licant-pre-requisites 
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Offers financial assistance for urgent or critical 
veterinary care, surgeries, therapies or mobility 
solutions that are too costly for pet parents. 

The Pet Fund 
https://thepetfund.com/for-pet-owners/the-pet-fun
d-application                                                                         
The Pet Fund only funds non-basic, non-urgent care.  
 
Pet News Daily 
https://petnewsdaily.com/financial-assistance/ 
Non-basic, non-urgent medical care) Covers only 
$200.  
 
Friends and Vets Helping Pets 
https://friendsandvetshelpingpets.org/need-assitanc
e/ 
Funds treatments for curable (lifesaving, not 
life-prolong) diseases such as tumors, broken bones, 
ambulatory care, expensive medication, or 
post-surgical prosthetics such as a K-9 cart. 
 
Onyx and Breezy 
https://www.onyxandbreezy.org/grant-application-fa
qs.html 
May fund spay/neuter and preventive care where 
hardship present. Can fund Urgent Care.  
 
Paws for a Cure 
http://www.paws4acure.org/askforhelp.php 
Provides assistance with veterinary care for all 
illnesses and injury treatment which also includes 
medication, insulin, heartworm positive treatment 
and medical equipment such as wheelchairs. 

Cancer 
Magic Bullet Fund 
https://themagicbulletfund.org/apply/ 
For cancer treatment including surgeries and 
treatment 
 
Miranda’s People 
https://www.mirandaspeople.org/FinancialAssistanc
e.htm#Cancer 
May help with costs of care and has a network of pro 
bono vets to help with care.  
 
Frankie’s Friends 
https://www.frankiesfriends.org/programs 
Can help cover care for cancer.  
 
Live like Roo 
https://www.livelikeroo.org/ 

Support and financial assistance for pets with cancer 
 
Fur the Brand 
https://www.furthebrand.com/assistance 
Will not cover 100% of cost of care.  

Wellness/Preventative Care                                                            
Onyx and Breezy 
https://www.onyxandbreezy.org/grant-application-fa
qs.html 
May fund spay/neuter and preventive care where 
hardship present. Can fund Urgent Care.  
 
Brown Dog Foundation  
https://www.browndogfoundation.org/ask-for-help#
APPLYFORASSISTANCE 
Not a lot of info on what they can cover but the 
application allows you to enter urgent care or spay 
neuter requests.  

Pitbull Rescue Central 
https://www.pbrc.net/spayneuterfund.html#/ 
Only supports with spay/neuter for pitties 
 
Bergen Spay & Neuter Alliance 
https://bergenspayandneuter.org/ 
Mobile spay & neuter clinic serving rural Colorado 
 

Other 
Frosted Face 
https://frostedfacesfoundation.org/frostedfunding 
We primarily provide veterinary care that is required 
to maintain and enhance the quality of life for senior 
animals.  We can also help with food, supplies, 
training, grooming, pet deposits, fence repairs, and 
impound fees. 
 
Sam Simon Foundation 
https://ssfmobileclinic.org/ 
Works in CA only, Maywood area. Free spay neuter 
and other surgeries including amputations, 
enucleation, etc.  
 
Handicapped Pets Foundation 
https://hpets.org/apply-for-wheelchair 
Donates wheelchairs to pets in need 
 
Tripawds Foundation 
https://tripawds.org/2016/12/tripawds-asap/                                              
Financial help with veterinary expenses related to 
amputation for their dog or cat 
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Labrador Lifeline                                                                         
https://labradorlifeline.org/ 
Provides assistance to lab owners and rescuers 
 
Tipper and Squirt Care for Cushing’s Fund 
http://www.tipper-squirtcushingfund.org/apply.html 
Financial help for vet costs associated with care for a 
dog with Cushing’s 
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