
Drew is a Certified Hudson Institute Coach and a member of the International 
Coach Federation. He has extensive coaching experience, along with 
expertise in mindfulness practices and teaching.  

Drew’s mindfulness and resilience training and teaching has spanned over 15 
years. He specializes in deep understating of the practices and how to make 
them practical and impactful in everyday life and work.  
Drew earned his B.A. in Liberal Arts and also received post-graduate training 
in marriage and family counseling. Before launching Accel 180, he most 
recently served as Director of Patient Experience for a major health care 
system in Washington State, and Executive Director for a non-profit 
foundation.  

Drew was a professional actor for over 15 years in New York City and Los 
Angeles, appearing in films, television and on stage (see credits on 
IMDB.com.) His acting experience helps inform his coaching work, as he 
encourages clients to face their fears, live into their personal truth, and learn 
to be completely present in each moment.  (see acting reel) 

A relatable, compelling and truly inspirational speaker, Drew shares his story 
of recovering from brain surgery and the rich learnings and practices that can 
authentically help transform your life.  He has a unique and powerful way of 
connecting with and shifting audiences hearts and minds.  

A resident of Tacoma, Washington, Drew is a Senior Fellow with the American 
Leadership Forum. He measures success by the level of positive, sustainable 
meaningful impact he has on the lives of those he serves. He is a life-long 
learner, and has learned that his challenges can be a source of energy.  
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https://www.imdb.com/name/nm0248117/?ref_=fn_al_nm_1
https://www.imdb.com/name/nm0248117/?ref_=fn_al_nm_1
https://www.youtube.com/watch?feature=youtu.be&v=-98axk_q5UE
http://accel180.com/

