
 
 

 Feedback provided by  
 

 
Presenter’s Name: ​ ​ ​ ​ ​ ​  

Content Poor       1 2 Acceptable    3 4  Excellent     5 

  The project was poorly 
presented. Supporting 
details and components 
are absent or vague. The 
main theme and 
supporting details are 
presented in a 
disorganized, unrelated 
way. 

  The project was 
clearly presented with 
most supporting 
details; generally 
meets requirements 
of assignment. 

  The project was well 
presented; effectively 
described all 
components requested 
for the assignment. Each 
segment relates to the 
others according to a 
carefully planned 
framework. 

Comments: 
  
  
  
  
  

Score:  
 
Did well:  
 
 
Could improve:  
 

Delivery Poor       1 2 Acceptable    3 4  Excellent     5 

  
  
  

Speaker appears 
unpracticed. Speech is 
rambling and unfocused: 
e.g., unnecessary 
pauses, filler words.  
Problems with voice 
control, eye contact, or 
posture.  Incorrect or 
inappropriate language. 
Visuals/notes are not 
used as needed. 

  Speaker appears 
proficient with 
language, vocal and 
physical expression. 
Speech 
demonstrates some 
grasp of organization, 
with a discernible 
theme and supporting 
details. Notes and 
visuals used as 
needed. 

  Smooth, effective 
delivery.  Good voice 
control, eye contact, and 
physical demeanor.  
Notes and visuals used 
to enhance the 
presentation, and are 
used effectively, without 
over-reliance on them. 
Speech is clear and is 
effectively organized. 

Comments: 
  
  
  
  
  

Score:  
 
Did well:  
 
 
Could improve:  
 

 

Overall​
impression 

Poor       1 2 Acceptable    3 4  Excellent     5 



 
 

 


