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1. Introduction 

YouTube Speed Control & A-B Loop ("we," "our," or "us") is committed to protecting your 
privacy. This Privacy Policy explains how we collect, use, and share information when you use 
our Chrome Extension, YouTube Speed Control & A-B Loop (the "Extension"). We never sell 
your personal information to third parties. We are committed to protecting your privacy. By using 
the Extension, you agree to the collection and use of information in accordance with this policy. 

2. Information We Collect 

We do not collect personal information such as your name, address, or contact details. 
However, 

●​ Usage Data: Information on how you use the Extension, including speed control 
preferences and A-B loop settings, to improve user experience and functionality. 

●​ Technical Data: Data related to your device, browser, and operating system to ensure 
compatibility and performance of the Extension on YouTube. 

3. Use of Information 

The information collected is used to: 

●​ Provide custom speed controls (60%, 70%, 75%, 80%, 90%) on YouTube videos you 
watch. 



●​ Enable A-B loop functionality for YouTube video segments. 

●​ Improve and enhance the functionality of the Extension. 

●​ Maintain and ensure the security and integrity of the Extension. 

4. Sharing of Information 

We do not sell, trade, or otherwise transfer your information to outside parties. We may share 
information only if: 

●​ Required by law or to comply with legal processes. 

●​ Necessary to enforce our policies or to protect our rights, property, or safety. 

5. Security of Information 

We implement reasonable security measures to protect your information from unauthorized 
access, use, or disclosure. However, no security system is impenetrable, and we cannot 
guarantee the absolute security of your information. 

6. Extension Data Storage 

Our Extension does not collect any personal information. The Extension operates exclusively on 
YouTube to provide speed control and A-B loop functionality. 

We do not gather any personal data from you. Any data stored, such as the Extension's settings 
or speed preferences, is saved locally on your device's storage. If you are using the Chrome 
Extension, this data may be synchronized with your Google Chrome account. However, we do 
not have access to or view this data. 



7. YouTube Integration 

This Extension works exclusively with YouTube videos to provide enhanced playback controls. 
The Extension only accesses YouTube pages to inject speed control buttons and A-B loop 
functionality. No video content or viewing habits are collected or transmitted. 

8. Changes to This Privacy Policy 

We may update our Privacy Policy from time to time. Any changes will be posted on this page, 
and we will update the “Last Updated” date at the top of this policy. Your continued use of the 
Extension after any modifications will constitute your acknowledgment of the changes and your 
consent to abide by and be bound by the modified policy. 
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