
Morning Announcements

 
 

September 2024 
 
 
Sept 30th 
 
Congratulations to all Speech and Debate students who competed Saturday at 
Pinecrest High School. Several students placed top in their events and the team placed 
5th overall. 
 
Today is the first day of our homecoming week! Hopefully you all remembered to wear 
your neon out and remember the themes for the rest of the week as well. Just as a 
quick reminder, tomorrow the theme is going to go back to three years ago when we did 
aliens vs. cowboys. 
 
Todays Events 
W. Tennis vs Cary 
M. Soccer @ Cary 
JV Football vs Holly Springs 
 
Sept 24th 
 
Anyone interested in learning more about CCP, Career and College Promise at Wake 
Tech, come join us for CCP Information Night on Tuesday, Sept. 24th at 6pm in the 
Auditorium. 
 
Kent State University will be outside of student services today during all three lunches 
Sept 23rd 
 
In homeroom today,please vote between 3 options of movies to watch at our Outdoor 
Movie Event to spread awareness about substance abuse and addiction. The options 
include The Nightmare Before Christmas, Hocus Pocus, or Hotel Transylvania. Make 
sure to choose wisely!  This event will be held on October 14th at 7:00 PM. 



 
Anyone interested in learning more about CCP, Career and College Promise at Wake 
Tech, come join us for CCP Information Night on Tuesday, Sept. 24th at 6pm in the 
Auditorium. 
 
Sept 19th 
 
A representative from Appalachian State University will be outside of student services 
during all three lunches today. 
 
Sept 17th 
 
A representative from Christopher Newport University will be outside of student services 
during all three lunches today. 
 
Sept 11 
 
If you have completed either Pre-Calc or Stats and are interested in Mu Alpha Theta, 
the math honor society, you should attend an interest meeting in room 3236 during Pat 
Time on Thursday, September 12. If you cannot attend or the Pat Time session is 
MAXED OUT, simply stop by room 3236 to talk to Ms. Frantz. 
 
A representative from the University of Alabama will be outside of student services 
during all three lunches today.  
 
Sept 10 
 
Any girls interested in trying out for the first AFHS Varsity Flag Football team, 
report to room 1515 at 2:30 on September 10. Any questions please email or see 
Coach Kreitzer. 
 
Attention artists! National Art Honor Society will be having their first meeting on 
September 12th during Pat Time in room 1208. Anyone interested in joining, 
please sign up! 
 
Sept 9th 
 
If you have completed either Pre-Calc or Stats and are interested in Mu Alpha Theta, 
the math honor society, you should attend an interest meeting in room 3236 during Pat 



Time on Thursday, September 12. If you cannot attend or the Pat Time session is 
MAXED OUT, simply stop by room 3236 to talk to Ms. Frantz. 
 
Speech and Debate will hold its interest meeting today after school from 2:30-3:30 in 
the Media Center. 
 
"Attention artists! National Art Honor Society will be having their first meeting on 
September 12th during Pat Time in room 1208. Anyone interested in joining, please sign 
up!" 
 
Sept 6th 
 
Any girls interested in trying out for the first AFHS Varsity Flag Football team, report to 
room 1515 at 2:30 on September 10. Any questions please email or see Coach Kreitzer. 
 
Attention Freshmen, if you are interested in running for Student Council, please see the 
main AFHS website for application and dates. You can see Ms. Wooten in 2237 for 
questions 
 
If you are interested in getting involved in community service, come to the Key Club 
interest meeting after school in the cafeteria on Tuesday September 10th at 2:30. 
 
Reminder, the Science National Honor Society application period will end this Sunday, 
September 8, 2024. Applications received after September 8 will NOT be considered. 
Please see Mrs. Cattrell for any questions. 
 
Columbia University will be here during all three lunches today outside of student 
services.  
 
Sept 5th 
 
Speech and Debate will hold an interest meeting on Monday, September 11 from 
2:30-3:30 in the Media Center. 
 
Reminder, the Science National Honor Society application period will end this Sunday, 
September 8, 2024. Applications received after September 8 will NOT be considered. 
Please see Mrs. Cattrell for any questions. 
 
There will be an Interest Meeting for the Library Media Club after school today, 
September 5th, in the library. Please see Mrs. Briggs if you have any questions. 



 
Sept 4th 
 
Attention Juniors and Seniors! Do you have a passion for Social Studies? There will be 
an interest meeting for Rho Kappa the National Social Studies Honor Society during 
Pat Time on September 16 in Room 4230. Sign up today! 
 
Any girls interested in trying out for the first AFHS Varsity Flag Football team, report to 
room 1515 at 2:30 on September 10. Any questions please email or see Coach Kreitzer. 
 
Sept 3rd 
 
Today is the last day for PSAT registration for students in grades 9-11. Registration will 
remain open until 11:59 pm today. Due to ordering deadlines, no late registrations will 
be accepted. Registration AND payment are required to complete registration. WCPSS 
will offer the test free of charge to AFHS juniors who have a weighted GPA of 4.375 or 
higher. These students were contacted directly via email by Mrs. Matthews about 
registering for the test. The registration form can be found on the AFHS website. Please 
see Mrs. Matthews for any additional questions.  
 
Attention Freshmen, if you are interested in running for Student Council, please see 
the main AFHS website for application and dates. You can see Ms. Wooten in 2237 for 
questions 


