
 

Share to Facebook and Instagram 

​
Copy and paste the social copy and meme images into your posts. It's that simple! 

Customize if you like, but be sure to keep it clear and direct them to the website listed 
where the petition is located. Feel free to add the following hashtags:  

#SetTheDateForSheen  

#FultonSheenMovement  

#BeatifySheen 
 
#UnpausetheCause 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 



SOCIAL COPY 1  

When will the Vatican set the date for Archbishop Fulton Sheen’s Beatification? Join the 
worldwide Fulton Sheen Movement, sign the petition, and let your voice be heard as 
together we urge the Sainthood Cause for Ven. Fulton J. Sheen to move forward! Sign 
the petition now! JMJ+  https://fultonsheenmovement.com 

 
 

 

 

https://email.mail.fultonsheenmovement.com/c/eJx0z0FPAjEQBeBfsz2SmXa2Ww49GBX1QOQkhAspbYdd0m5XqAr_3sDJi9eXl_fl-d0Q7Msq5c36cpzWq2fu2u1Sp3cRLDoEo42IFrWR81aC1iJmN6RdvU7RepcnNxzGP9ltTRMFQyFoIm-CaXUwLc_ne9FbZAYGQLeX0KFCw9GQj547TYzoxWAlSAUtIBIh0MwH1REoZqWMDgobghs2469Uy3juYxxz-Y45jnXmSxbJ9rVO50Y9NHLRyMW_vXJ_flleP19LwI1SvH2Kjx_HNyNO1vdurC715cedQkNwuJu-5N8AAAD__8o9YTw


SOCIAL COPY 2 

​
Unpause the Cause! A dead-stopped Cause for Canonization for one of America’s most 
beloved bishops has spurred an urgent petition to reopen and move forward with his 
cause for sainthood and to put a spotlight on the paused cause. Led by Dr. Peter 
Howard, founder of the Fulton J. Sheen Institute, the petition aims to reignite the Cause 
for Canonization of Fulton Sheen with a SET THE DATE FOR SHEEN campaign. Sign 
the petition now!  https://fultonsheenmovement.com 

 
 

 

 

https://email.mail.fultonsheenmovement.com/c/eJx0z0FPAjEQBeBfsz2SmXa2Ww49GBX1QOQkhAspbYdd0m5XqAr_3sDJi9eXl_fl-d0Q7Msq5c36cpzWq2fu2u1Sp3cRLDoEo42IFrWR81aC1iJmN6RdvU7RepcnNxzGP9ltTRMFQyFoIm-CaXUwLc_ne9FbZAYGQLeX0KFCw9GQj547TYzoxWAlSAUtIBIh0MwH1REoZqWMDgobghs2469Uy3juYxxz-Y45jnXmSxbJ9rVO50Y9NHLRyMW_vXJ_flleP19LwI1SvH2Kjx_HNyNO1vdurC715cedQkNwuJu-5N8AAAD__8o9YTw


SOCIAL COPY 3 

​
Set the Date for Sheen! The people of God want to know when Archbishop Fulton 
Sheen’s cause will be unpaused! Sheen, an Emmy Award-winning Catholic bishop, host 
of "Life is Worth Living,” and a media pioneer was often characterized as America’s first 
televangelist. He is the author of over 70 published works such as Treasure in Clay, 
Three to Get Married, Lift Up Your Heart, Life of Christ, and The World’s First Love. He 
brought Christ to the masses and yet his date with destiny, the date to elevate him to 
sainthood, has been slow-walked, blocked, and utterly forgotten. We won’t let that 
happen. Sign the petition today!  https://fultonsheenmovement.com 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 

https://email.mail.fultonsheenmovement.com/c/eJx0z0FPAjEQBeBfsz2SmXa2Ww49GBX1QOQkhAspbYdd0m5XqAr_3sDJi9eXl_fl-d0Q7Msq5c36cpzWq2fu2u1Sp3cRLDoEo42IFrWR81aC1iJmN6RdvU7RepcnNxzGP9ltTRMFQyFoIm-CaXUwLc_ne9FbZAYGQLeX0KFCw9GQj547TYzoxWAlSAUtIBIh0MwH1REoZqWMDgobghs2469Uy3juYxxz-Y45jnXmSxbJ9rVO50Y9NHLRyMW_vXJ_flleP19LwI1SvH2Kjx_HNyNO1vdurC715cedQkNwuJu-5N8AAAD__8o9YTw


SOCIAL COPY 4 

​
The stunning silence from the Vatican and American Catholic hierarchy, nor any signal 
that this will move forward, is what ignited the Fulton Sheen Movement and its global 
petition, the SET THE DATE FOR SHEEN campaign. The Movement’s founder, Dr. Peter 
Howard, stated Sheen’s universal impact and significance were demonstrated within the 
first 15 hours of the petition’s launch as signatures came in from all six inhabited 
continents. Ven. Fulton J. Sheen was scheduled to be beatified in December 2019, when 
just weeks before the anticipated Peoria event, the beatification was abruptly canceled 
with no explanation from Catholic officials. Please sign the petition now!  
https://fultonsheenmovement.com 

 
 

 

 

https://email.mail.fultonsheenmovement.com/c/eJx0z0FPAjEQBeBfsz2SmXa2Ww49GBX1QOQkhAspbYdd0m5XqAr_3sDJi9eXl_fl-d0Q7Msq5c36cpzWq2fu2u1Sp3cRLDoEo42IFrWR81aC1iJmN6RdvU7RepcnNxzGP9ltTRMFQyFoIm-CaXUwLc_ne9FbZAYGQLeX0KFCw9GQj547TYzoxWAlSAUtIBIh0MwH1REoZqWMDgobghs2469Uy3juYxxz-Y45jnXmSxbJ9rVO50Y9NHLRyMW_vXJ_flleP19LwI1SvH2Kjx_HNyNO1vdurC715cedQkNwuJu-5N8AAAD__8o9YTw


SOCIAL COPY 5 

​
Archbishop Fulton Sheen is truly America’s bishop and a saint in the making that our 
country and world need today! Help us drive awareness to his paused cause and urge 
that Church officials SET THE DATE FOR SHEEN today! Please sign the petition now!  
https://fultonsheenmovement.com 

 
 

 

 

 

https://email.mail.fultonsheenmovement.com/c/eJx0z0FPAjEQBeBfsz2SmXa2Ww49GBX1QOQkhAspbYdd0m5XqAr_3sDJi9eXl_fl-d0Q7Msq5c36cpzWq2fu2u1Sp3cRLDoEo42IFrWR81aC1iJmN6RdvU7RepcnNxzGP9ltTRMFQyFoIm-CaXUwLc_ne9FbZAYGQLeX0KFCw9GQj547TYzoxWAlSAUtIBIh0MwH1REoZqWMDgobghs2469Uy3juYxxz-Y45jnXmSxbJ9rVO50Y9NHLRyMW_vXJ_flleP19LwI1SvH2Kjx_HNyNO1vdurC715cedQkNwuJu-5N8AAAD__8o9YTw
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