
The Seoul SK Knights defeated the Wonju DB Promy 76-68 in the "2023-2024 Jeonggwanjang 
Professional Basketball League" held at Jamsil Students' Gymnasium on Tuesday. SK, which 
snapped a two-game losing streak, trailed the leading DB by three games with 23 wins and 10 
losses. Jamsil Students' Gymnasium was packed with spectators on the day. After being hit by 
SK, DB ended its three-game winning streak and recorded 26 wins and seven losses. 
 
It was like an unexpected event. Even though the No. 1 and No. 2 teams were competing, SK 
Wyverns' Kim Sun-hyung, Ahn Young-joon, and Huh Il-young were out of power due to injury. 
Even SK Wyverns' manager Jeon Hee-chul acknowledged the power gap by saying, "It is not 
easy to win. DB is so good in offense and defense." However, SK had an unusual power and 
won the game. SK also showed great performance by failing to give a lead to DB from the 
beginning to the end of the game. 
 
Lion King Oh Se-hoon led his team to victory with 24 points and six rebounds. Jamil Warney, the 
"main gun," also contributed with 20 points and 19 rebounds. And the "Eonsung Hero" was 
Song Chang-yong. 
 
Song Chang-yong was put in the starting lineup due to injuries to the main forwards Ahn 
Young-joon and Heo Il-young, and did his job faithfully. He controlled his height in defense and 
rarely gave up an attack opportunity in matchups with Kang Sang-jae. Song Chang-yong 
attempted five three points and three separated the rim. In particular, in the third quarter, when 
DB persistently followed by three points, Song Chang-yong scored three points that dampened 
his willingness to chase. 
 
In a press conference after the game, Song Chang-yong said, "I'm very happy to have the No. 1 
team. The main players were missing, but the other players united well and won." 
 
He played for more than 33 minutes and scored double-digit points (11 points). "From yesterday, 
I thought, 'Can I run?'" Song said. "But it was okay when I actually ran. My team has a lot of 
tactics derived from Wonyi. So when I had a chance to shoot, I shot without thinking. I got in this 
part better." 
 
How much did you score for yourself as a coach for winning? When asked, Song said, "It's 
70-80 out of 100. I had a chance, but I hesitated and shot a tough shot. That was a 
disappointment. I am strict about myself." However, Oh Se-geun, who was next to me, said, "It's 
120 out of 100. You did a great job. You can give me a higher score." 
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