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Welcome to the vibrant world of New Orleans second line parades, where the streets come alive 
with music, color, and celebration. 
 
As you step onto the red carpet that guides these joyful processions, you are instantly immersed 
in a centuries-old tradition that has become an integral part of the city's culture. 
 
The red carpet symbolizes not only a physical path for the parade but also a metaphorical 
invitation for you to join in on this exuberant display of community spirit. 
 
In this article, we will delve into the origins and meaning behind these captivating parades, 
exploring their deep-rooted connection to New Orleans' history and heritage. 
 
We will uncover how music plays a central role in driving the energy of second line parades, 
infusing every step with infectious rhythms that compel both participants and spectators alike to 
dance along. 
 
From vibrant costumes and decorations to traditions and rituals that have been passed down 
through generations, we will discover how these parades bring people together in a shared 
experience of joyous celebration. 
 
So grab your dancing shoes and prepare to be swept away by the irresistible charm of New 
Orleans second line parades – an experience that will leave you feeling like part of something 
truly special. 
 

Key Takeaways 
 
- Red carpet symbolizes the resilience and determination of the African American community in 
New Orleans. 
- Second line parades are a vibrant tradition that dates back to the 19th century and originated 
from the African American community. 
- Music plays a central role in second line parades, infusing every step with infectious rhythms 
and paying tribute to jazz, blues, and gospel traditions. 
- Second line parades celebrate diversity while embracing unity, bringing people together in a 
shared experience of joyous celebration and community. 
 

The Origins of Second Line Parades 
 
Now, let me tell you all about the fascinating origins of those lively second line parades in New 
Orleans! 
 
These vibrant processions have a rich history that dates back to the 19th century. The origins of 
second line parades can be traced back to the African American community and their traditions 
of celebrating life, music, and dance. 



 
In the early days, these parades were a way for social aid and pleasure clubs to come together 
and commemorate important events such as funerals or weddings. They would march through 
the streets with brass bands leading the way, playing lively tunes that filled the air with infectious 
energy. 
 
As time went on, these parades became an integral part of New Orleans' cultural fabric, 
representing resilience and joy in the face of adversity. 
 
The history behind second line parades is a testament to the enduring spirit of New Orleans. It 
speaks volumes about the city's ability to turn sorrow into celebration and to find solace in music 
and dance. 
 
Now that you know where these parades originated from, let's dive into the meaning behind the 
red carpet that adorns their path. 
 

The Meaning Behind the Red Carpet 
 
Imagine walking down a path that symbolizes honor and celebration, where every step you take 
represents the rich cultural significance of this tradition. 
 
The red carpet laid out for New Orleans second line parades holds a deep history and 
symbolism. It dates back to the early 20th century when African Americans in New Orleans 
celebrated their culture through vibrant street processions. The red color of the carpet is not just 
any random choice; it represents the resilience, strength, and determination of a community that 
has overcome countless challenges throughout history. 
 
The red carpet serves as a visual reminder of the struggles and triumphs that have shaped the 
African American experience in New Orleans. As you walk along its length, you are not only 
honoring those who came before you but also acknowledging your own place within this living 
tradition. Each step carries with it a sense of pride and belonging, connecting you to generations 
past and those yet to come. 
 
The red carpet is more than just a decorative element; it is an embodiment of history, a pathway 
to unity, and a testament to the power of community resilience. As we delve further into the role 
of music in second line parades, let's continue on this journey together, guided by the rhythm 
and spirit that flows through every beat. 
 
Transition: Just as each step on the red carpet holds significance, so does each note played 
during these parades. Let's now explore how music takes center stage in shaping the vibrant 
atmosphere of second line celebrations. 
 

 



The Role of Music in Second Line Parades 
 
As you step into the vibrant world of second line celebrations, the music becomes your 
heartbeat, pulsating through the streets like a joyful symphony. 
 
The role of instruments in these parades is crucial, as they create the infectious rhythms that 
compel everyone to move and dance. From the booming bass drums to the blaring trumpets, 
each instrument adds its own unique voice to the collective melody of the parade. 
 
It's impossible not to be swept up in this musical energy, as it reverberates through your body 
and connects you with those around you. 
 
The cultural significance of music in second line parades cannot be overstated. It serves as a 
bridge between past and present, honoring New Orleans' rich musical heritage while also 
embracing contemporary styles. The syncopated beats and improvisational melodies pay tribute 
to jazz, blues, and gospel traditions that have shaped this city's identity. 
 
As you immerse yourself in this sonic tapestry, you can feel the spirit of generations who came 
before you, celebrating life and community through music. 
 
With vibrant costumes and decorations adorning every participant, second line parades are a 
feast for both the eyes and ears. The colorful fabrics sway with each step taken to the rhythm of 
the music, creating a visual representation of the joyous atmosphere. 
 
As you continue on this journey through New Orleans' second lines, prepare yourself for an 
explosion of color and creativity that will envelop your senses completely. 
 

Vibrant Costumes and Decorations 
 
Get ready to be dazzled by the explosion of color and creativity that fills the streets during these 
vibrant celebrations. Second line parades in New Orleans are known for their stunning costume 
designs and elaborate decorations, which add an extra layer of excitement to the festivities. 
 
As you watch the parade go by, you'll see a kaleidoscope of colors, from bright purples and 
blues to fiery reds and oranges. The costumes worn by the participants are not just ordinary 
outfits; they are works of art that reflect the rich cultural heritage of New Orleans. 
 
Each costume is carefully crafted to showcase both individuality and unity within the group. 
Feathers, sequins, beads, and ribbons adorn every inch, creating a visual feast for your eyes. 
You'll also notice intricate mask designs that add an air of mystery to the procession. Parade 
floats play a significant role in this visual spectacle as well. These elaborately decorated mobile 
stages bring larger-than-life characters to life and transport you into a whimsical world filled with 
fantasy. 



 
As you immerse yourself in this vibrant display of costumes and decorations, you can't help but 
feel a sense of belonging among the crowd. The joyous spirit exuded by everyone around you is 
infectious, drawing you deeper into this communal experience. But it's not just about being part 
of something bigger; it's about celebrating diversity while embracing unity. 
 
Transition: And speaking of unity, let's delve into the joyous spirit that infuses second line 
parades as people come together to dance through the streets with unbridled energy and 
enthusiasm, creating a vibrant and infectious atmosphere that can uplift the entire community. 
 

The Joyous Spirit of Second Line Parades 
 
Experience the electrifying atmosphere as you join the lively procession, dancing through the 
streets with uncontainable energy and infectious enthusiasm. The joyous spirit of second line 
parades is truly contagious, captivating both locals and tourists alike. 
 
As you immerse yourself in this vibrant celebration, you can't help but feel a sense of belonging 
and connection to the rich cultural heritage of New Orleans. 
 
1. The Cultural Significance: Every step you take in sync with the rhythmic beats of the brass 
bands holds immense cultural significance. Second line parades have deep roots in African 
American traditions and serve as a symbol of resilience and community. It's a time when 
generations come together to honor their ancestors, express their identity, and keep their 
heritage alive. 
 
2. The Role of Dance: Dancing becomes an integral part of this lively spectacle, allowing 
individuals to fully express themselves through movement. From traditional steps passed down 
through generations to spontaneous freestyle moves, dance serves as a powerful medium for 
self-expression and connection. With every sway of your hips or kick of your feet, you become 
part of an ancient tradition that celebrates life itself. 
 
3. The Infectious Energy: As the music fills the air and dancers twirl around you with 
exuberance, an overwhelming surge of energy takes hold of everyone present. It's impossible 
not to be swept up by this infectious enthusiasm that permeates every corner of the parade 
route. Smiles are contagious, laughter echoes through the streets, and for a moment in time, all 
worries are forgotten amidst this collective jubilation. 
 
4. A Sense of Belonging: Whether you're a local or visiting from afar, participating in a second 
line parade fosters an inherent sense of belonging. In these moments, boundaries dissolve as 
people from different walks of life come together to celebrate their shared humanity. You 
become part of something bigger than yourself – an interconnected tapestry where individual 
voices merge into one harmonious chorus. 
 
As you revel in the joyous spirit of second line parades and feel a deep sense of belonging, the 



participation of both locals and tourists becomes an integral part of this vibrant celebration. 
 

The Participation of Locals and Tourists 
 
The vibrant celebration of second line parades unites both locals and tourists, weaving a 
tapestry of joyous energy and shared connection. 
 
As the brass bands march through the streets, their infectious melodies beckon people from all 
walks of life to join in the festivities. The participation dynamics of these parades are truly 
remarkable, as they blur the lines between performers and spectators. 
 
Locals proudly showcase their dance moves passed down through generations, while tourists 
eagerly immerse themselves in this unique cultural experience. It is in these moments that 
barriers dissolve, creating a sense of belonging that transcends geographical boundaries. 
 
Not only do second line parades foster a feeling of togetherness, but they also have a significant 
economic impact on the city of New Orleans. As visitors flock to witness these one-of-a-kind 
celebrations, local businesses thrive with increased patronage. From hotels and restaurants to 
street vendors selling colorful masks and beaded necklaces, the entire community benefits from 
this influx of tourism. 
 
Moreover, it's not just about monetary gains; it's about showcasing the spirit and resilience of 
New Orleans' culture to the world. 
 
With dancing and singing in the streets serving as a natural segue into our next section on 
'dancing and singing in the streets,' one can't help but marvel at how second line parades bring 
out the inner joy within each participant. 
 

Dancing and Singing in the Streets 
 
Dancing and singing reverberate through the vibrant streets, infusing the atmosphere with a 
pulsating rhythm that captivates all who partake. 
 
As you stroll along the red carpet of a New Orleans second line parade, you'll witness an array 
of street performers showcasing their talents. Local musicians create infectious beats on their 
drums, while talented dancers twirl and sway to the music with grace and passion. 
 
The energy is contagious, drawing in both locals and tourists alike to join in the celebration of 
New Orleans' rich cultural heritage. 
 
These performances not only entertain but also serve as a way for communities to come 
together and express themselves. It's a beautiful sight to see people from all walks of life joining 
hands, moving in unison, celebrating their shared love for music and dance. This collective 



experience creates a sense of belonging that transcends barriers and fosters unity among 
strangers-turned-friends. 
 
Transitioning into the subsequent section about 'the route and structure of the parade', one can't 
help but be swept away by this wave of euphoria that permeates every corner of New Orleans 
during these second line parades. 
 

The Route and Structure of the Parade 
 
As you meander through the vibrant streets, you'll be swept up in a rhythmic current of 
celebration and camaraderie, as if being carried along by the flowing river of a joyous carnival. 
 
The parade route for New Orleans' second line parades is carefully planned to weave through 
the heart of the city, showcasing its lively neighborhoods and vibrant culture. From the historic 
French Quarter to the bustling Treme neighborhood, each block pulsates with energy as 
revelers dance, sing, and play music together. 
 
The parade structure itself is a testament to the rich traditions and deep-rooted sense of 
community that define these events. Led by a brass band or 'first line,' participants follow behind 
in what is known as the 'second line.' As you join in on this exuberant procession, you'll find 
yourself surrounded by a sea of colorful umbrellas twirling overhead and sashaying dancers 
moving to infectious rhythms. 
 
The parade route often includes stops at significant landmarks or gathering spots where 
participants can rest, hydrate, and soak in the atmosphere before continuing on their jubilant 
journey. 
 
In this way, second line parades serve as more than just spectacles or entertainment; they are 
an integral part of New Orleans' cultural fabric and a profound symbol of communal spirit. As we 
delve deeper into exploring 'the importance of community in second line parades,' we will 
uncover how these parades foster connections among individuals from all walks of life and 
create a space where everyone feels like they belong. 
 

The Importance of Community in Second Line 
Parades 
 
Immerse yourself in the vibrant and inclusive atmosphere of a second line parade, where the 
sense of community is palpable and you can't help but feel like you belong. These parades 
aren't just about marching down the streets with music and dancing; they're about community 
engagement and cultural significance. 
 
- **Community Engagement**: Second line parades bring people from all walks of life together, 



creating a space where everyone feels welcome. It's an opportunity for neighbors to come out of 
their homes, meet each other, and celebrate their shared love for New Orleans culture. The 
parade route becomes a red carpet for locals to showcase their solidarity and unity. 
 
- **Cultural Significance**: Second line parades are deeply rooted in the African-American 
traditions that have shaped New Orleans' cultural landscape. They serve as a way to honor 
ancestors, pay homage to historical figures, and preserve heritage through music, dance, and 
attire. The parade becomes a living testament to the resilience of the community and its 
commitment to keeping these traditions alive. 
 
- **Sense of Belonging**: Being part of a second line parade gives individuals a sense of 
belonging that transcends social barriers. In this communal gathering, everyone is equal; it 
doesn't matter where you come from or what your background is. You become part of something 
bigger than yourself - a rich tapestry woven by generations before you. 
 
In the next section about 'traditions and rituals associated with second line parades', we'll 
explore how these events go beyond mere celebrations and encompass deep-rooted customs 
that have been passed down through generations. 
 

Traditions and Rituals Associated with Second Line 
Parades 
 
Now that we've explored the importance of community in second line parades, let's dive into the 
rich traditions and rituals associated with these vibrant celebrations. 
 
When you step onto the red carpet of a New Orleans second line parade, you are transported 
into a world steeped in cultural significance. Every aspect of the parade holds deep meaning 
and serves to connect individuals to their roots. 
 
From the lively music played by brass bands to the colorful attire worn by participants, each 
element of a second line parade is carefully chosen to reflect and honor New Orleans' unique 
heritage. The rhythmic beats of the drums and trumpets create an infectious energy that fills the 
streets, inviting everyone to join in on this joyous celebration. 
 
As you move along with the crowd, you'll witness social interactions like no other. Strangers 
become friends as they dance together, sharing laughter and smiles. It's a beautiful display of 
unity and camaraderie, where all barriers disappear in the face of such exuberance. 
 
This sense of belonging is what makes second line parades so special - they bring people from 
different walks of life together under one shared experience. These traditions serve as a 
reminder of our collective history and provide an opportunity for us to celebrate our diversity 
while also reveling in our commonalities. 
 



So now that we understand the cultural significance and social interactions found within these 
parades, let's explore how they have left an indelible mark on New Orleans culture as a whole. 
 

The Impact of Second Line Parades on New Orleans 
Culture 
 
Step into the vibrant world of second line celebrations and witness how these joyous parades 
have left an indelible mark on the rich culture of New Orleans. 
 
Second line parades not only bring people together in a joyful celebration, but they also have a 
significant impact on the local economy. As thousands of locals and tourists alike gather to 
participate in or watch these lively processions, businesses thrive with increased sales of food, 
drinks, and merchandise. From street vendors selling delicious Creole dishes to bars 
overflowing with patrons thirsty for a taste of New Orleans' famous cocktails, the economic 
boost from second line parades is undeniable. 
 
The cultural significance of these parades cannot be overstated either. They serve as living 
embodiments of New Orleans' unique heritage and traditions. The music that accompanies 
second line parades is deeply rooted in African rhythms mixed with European influences, 
creating a distinct sound that resonates through the streets. This fusion reflects the diverse 
history and multiculturalism that defines the city itself. Furthermore, second line parades provide 
a platform for showcasing various aspects of New Orleans' culture such as Mardi Gras Indians, 
brass bands, and social aid and pleasure clubs. These elements come together to create an 
atmosphere full of energy, pride, and unity among participants and spectators alike. 
 
Transitioning into the subsequent section about the evolution of second line parades over time, 
it's fascinating to see how these celebrations have evolved while maintaining their core 
essence. 
 

The Evolution of Second Line Parades Over Time 
 
As you delve into the history, you'll witness how these jubilant processions have transformed 
and adapted throughout the years. 
 
Second line parades in New Orleans have experienced an evolution of celebrations that reflects 
the ever-changing cultural landscape of this vibrant city. From their humble beginnings as 
funeral processions to their current status as a symbol of community and resilience, second line 
parades have become an integral part of New Orleans' identity. 
 
The evolution of second line parades is a testament to the cultural significance they hold for the 
people of New Orleans. Originally rooted in African traditions brought by enslaved individuals, 
these parades were initially somber affairs accompanying funerals. However, over time, they 



began to take on a more celebratory tone. The music became livelier, the dancing more 
exuberant, and the sense of joy permeated every aspect of these gatherings. 
 
Today, second line parades are not just about mourning or celebrating life; they are a 
manifestation of unity and solidarity within communities. 
 
In preserving and promoting second line parades for future generations, it is crucial to 
understand their historical roots while also embracing their contemporary significance. These 
joyful processions have evolved from funeral rituals to expressions of shared culture and 
resilience. By acknowledging this evolution and continuing to celebrate second line parades with 
enthusiasm and pride, we ensure that future generations can experience the same sense of 
belonging and connection that has made them such an integral part of New Orleans' fabric. 
 

Preserving and Promoting Second Line Parades for 
Future Generations 
 
Preserving and promoting the vibrant tradition of second line parades ensures that future 
generations can partake in the exuberant celebrations that have become a cherished 
expression of community and resilience. These parades, deeply rooted in New Orleans' rich 
cultural history, hold immense value as they symbolize the strength and unity of the local 
community. 
 
By preserving these traditions, we honor our ancestors who created and nurtured this unique 
form of celebration, passing down their legacy to future generations. 
 
In order to evoke a sense of belonging and appreciation for these parades, it's important to 
understand their cultural significance. Second line parades originated during the era of slavery 
when African Americans were restricted from participating in traditional European-style 
processions. They became a means for marginalized communities to come together, celebrating 
life's joys and triumphs through music, dance, and colorful attire. 
 
Today, these parades continue to serve as a powerful symbol of resilience against adversity and 
an affirmation of cultural identity. 
 
Preserving second line parades isn't just about upholding traditions; it's about honoring the spirit 
of New Orleans itself. The nested bullet point list below highlights three emotional aspects 
associated with these celebrations: 
 
- **Community Bonding:** Second line parades foster strong bonds among participants by 
creating an atmosphere where everyone feels included and valued. They provide an opportunity 
for people from all walks of life to come together in joyous harmony. 
 
- **Cultural Resilience:** Through their preservation, second line parades serve as a testament 



to the enduring strength and resilience of New Orleans' diverse communities. In times of 
hardship or tragedy, they remind us that our culture remains unshakable. 
 
- **Expression through Artistry:** Second lines aren't just processions; they're vibrant 
showcases for artistic expression through music, dance, costume design, and creativity. 
Preserving them ensures that future generations have a platform to express themselves 
artistically while keeping alive the unique traditions that define our city. 
 
By preserving and promoting second line parades, we ensure that future generations can 
experience the joy, pride, and sense of belonging that these celebrations bring. It's through our 
collective efforts that we can safeguard the cultural heritage of New Orleans and pass it on to 
those who'll continue to shape its vibrant tapestry for years to come. 
 

Frequently Asked Questions 
 
Are second line parades only held in New Orleans, or are they 
celebrated in other cities as well? 
 
Other cities have joined in the vibrant celebration of second line parades, embracing the lively 
traditions and customs that go beyond the boundaries of New Orleans. 
 
These jubilant processions, with their infectious energy and rhythmic music, can now be found 
in various corners of our great nation. 
 
From the streets of Atlanta to the neighborhoods of Chicago, second line parades have become 
a symbol of camaraderie and a testament to the enduring spirit of community. 
 
The colorful umbrellas twirling in unison, the brass bands playing soulful melodies, and the 
joyful dancers moving to the rhythm create an atmosphere that transcends geographical 
boundaries. 
 
So if you find yourself yearning for a sense of belonging and a shared experience that brings 
people together, look no further than these exuberant second line parades in cities far and wide 
- where you'll discover your own place within this tapestry of celebration. 
 
How long do second line parades typically last? 
 
Second line parades, with their vibrant energy and infectious rhythm, are a sight to behold. 
When it comes to their duration, these parades typically last anywhere from two to four hours. 
However, the true significance of a second line parade extends far beyond its time frame. 
 
These parades are deeply rooted in traditions that have been passed down through 
generations, serving as a testament to the rich cultural heritage of New Orleans. They bring 



together community members from all walks of life, creating a sense of unity and belonging that 
is truly unparalleled. 
 
From the spirited brass bands leading the way to the colorful umbrellas twirling in the air, every 
aspect of a second line parade is infused with enthusiasm and joy. So if you find yourself amidst 
one of these lively processions, don't just watch from the sidelines—join in on the celebration 
and let yourself become part of this cherished cultural experience. 
 
Is there an age limit for participating in a second line parade? 
 
Age restrictions for participating in a second line parade? Not to worry, my friend! There's no 
age limit when it comes to joining the vibrant procession. Whether you're young or old, everyone 
is welcome to dance their way through the streets of New Orleans. 
 
It's a celebration that transcends generations, bringing people together in a harmonious display 
of joy and unity. So grab your dancing shoes and join in on the fun! But remember, like any 
gathering, there are participation guidelines to ensure everyone's safety and enjoyment. 
 
Keep an eye out for instructions from the parade organizers and be respectful of others as you 
groove to the infectious rhythms that fill the air. Now get ready to immerse yourself in the rich 
culture and lively spirit of New Orleans' second line parades – where age knows no bounds and 
everyone finds their place in this captivating tapestry of tradition. 
 
Are there specific rules or guidelines for creating costumes and 
decorations for a second line parade? 
 
When it comes to participating in a second line parade, costume creativity and parade 
decorations are key elements that can truly make the experience unforgettable. There are no 
specific rules or guidelines for creating costumes and decorations, which gives you the freedom 
to let your imagination run wild. 
 
Whether you want to dress up as a vibrant butterfly or decorate your umbrella with colorful 
feathers and beads, the possibilities are endless. The more unique and eye-catching your 
costume and decorations are, the more you'll stand out in the crowd and feel like an integral part 
of this lively celebration. 
 
So go ahead, let your creativity shine and create a costume that reflects your personality and 
brings joy to those around you. With every step you take in your beautifully adorned outfit, you'll 
become a living work of art that adds an extra touch of magic to the second line parade 
experience. 
 
How can individuals and organizations contribute to the preservation 
and promotion of second line parades for future generations? 



 
Preserving traditions and ensuring the promotion of second line parades for future generations 
requires active community involvement. By participating in these vibrant celebrations, 
individuals and organizations contribute to the preservation of this rich cultural heritage. 
 
It is through their collective efforts that the spirit and essence of these parades can be passed 
down to future generations, keeping alive a tradition that has deep roots in New Orleans' history. 
 
Whether it's through financial support, volunteering, or simply attending these parades with 
enthusiasm, each person plays a vital role in preserving this unique form of expression. 
 
These parades not only bring joy and unity to the community but also serve as a reminder of our 
shared identity and belongingness. 
 
Therefore, by actively engaging in and supporting second line parades, we ensure that this 
cherished tradition continues to thrive for years to come. 
 

Conclusion 
 
In conclusion, as you walk along the vibrant red carpet of New Orleans' second line parades, 
you're not merely witnessing a celebration, but stepping into a symbol of resilience and joy. 
 
The red carpet represents the spirit of the city, a resilient community that's risen above 
challenges with an unwavering determination to celebrate life. It serves as a reminder that 
despite hardships, there's always room for music, laughter, and unity. 
 
The red carpet also symbolizes the rich cultural heritage of New Orleans. It's reminiscent of 
Mardi Gras and its lavish festivities, where people come together in dazzling costumes to dance 
and revel in the streets. Just like these parades, the red carpet signifies a collective expression 
of identity and pride. 
 
As you immerse yourself in the sights and sounds of second line parades, it becomes evident 
that they're not just events but living traditions passed down through generations. They embody 
the essence of New Orleans' culture – vibrant music, colorful costumes, and boundless 
enthusiasm. These parades have evolved over time to become more than just celebrations; 
they're symbols of resilience and unity in the face of adversity. 
 
It's essential to preserve and promote these precious traditions for future generations so that 
they may continue to experience the magic of New Orleans' second line parades. Just as each 
step on the red carpet signifies a connection to history and tradition, let's tread carefully on this 
path towards preserving our cultural roots. By embracing these parades with open arms and 
sharing their significance with others around us, we can ensure that their vibrant spirit lives on 
for years to come. 
 



So next time you find yourself walking along that crimson pathway amidst lively music and 
exuberant dancers during a second line parade in New Orleans, remember that it represents 
more than just a celebration - it embodies resilience, culture, unity, and history all rolled into one 
enchanting experience. Let's cherish this symbolic journey together as we continue dancing to 
the rhythm of New Orleans and honoring its extraordinary heritage. 
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https://www.redcarpetrunner.com/carpet-runners
https://www.redcarpetrunner.com/rugs


Other Recommended Links 
 

Google Business Site 
https://red-carpet-runner.busines
s.site/ https://mgyb.co/s/dVJGx https://is.gd/ybc0sU 

Google Site 
https://sites.google.com/view/red
carpetrunner/ https://mgyb.co/s/qEMdC https://is.gd/QqT6PC 

Amazon S3 

https://red-carpet-runner.s3.us-e
ast-2.amazonaws.com/index.htm
l https://mgyb.co/s/RWcJX https://is.gd/gkiyMu 

Pearltrees 
http://www.pearltrees.com/redcar
petrunner https://mgyb.co/s/vgcQq https://is.gd/j4VXln 

Youtube 

https://www.youtube.com/chann
el/UCTbJCRf2NaPqi4N3fhPBy9
g https://mgyb.co/s/nhaWo https://is.gd/lfJOa7 

Blogger 
https://redcarpetrunner.blogspot.
com https://mgyb.co/s/TuodE https://is.gd/9bOLa2 

Wordpress 
https://redcarpetrunner.wordpres
s.com https://mgyb.co/s/zQUNq https://is.gd/06PdON 

Gravatar 
https://en.gravatar.com/redcarpe
trunner https://mgyb.co/s/XoXaA https://is.gd/Ukqlw6 

Tumblr 
https://redcarpetrunner.tumblr.co
m https://mgyb.co/s/AJYrf https://is.gd/YDAAhP 

Twitter 
https://twitter.com/TheRedCarpet
Guy https://mgyb.co/s/xWRvK https://is.gd/VFijSl 

Diigo 
https://www.diigo.com/profile/red
carpetrunner https://mgyb.co/s/DkNok https://is.gd/F9IVEg 

Evernote 
https://www.evernote.com/pub/m
icheleckeefer/redcarpetrunner https://mgyb.co/s/lKrid https://is.gd/pswxVs 

Google Doc 

https://drive.google.com/drive/fol
ders/1kVLxv_g2Ae7uxyZBliX16
SzmkaP2gIWh https://mgyb.co/s/SIOCE https://is.gd/yPSigF 

Google Doc 

https://drive.google.com/drive/fol
ders/1kVLxv_g2Ae7uxyZBliX16
SzmkaP2gIWh?usp=sharing https://mgyb.co/s/ALgYQ https://is.gd/sRtHzH 

Google Drive Files 

https://drive.google.com/drive/fol
ders/1DDx7nxkdahrx9syIcw5h1f
rww6n0HUfO https://mgyb.co/s/chNam https://is.gd/iTcne3 

GDrive Red Carpet 
Articles 

https://drive.google.com/drive/fol
ders/1l99A4DCvZwWExqY3EbY
UWLjWTbXPnqUP?usp=sharing https://mgyb.co/s/Vuxsm https://is.gd/CdDuTg 

Google Drive Files 

https://drive.google.com/drive/fol
ders/1DDx7nxkdahrx9syIcw5h1f
rww6n0HUfO?usp=drive_open https://mgyb.co/s/WQXNj https://is.gd/65Zn4R 

OneNote 

https://1drv.ms/o/s!AoSwVdfCk2i
Vcc903_xW0YSCmB8?e=jmTsD
G https://mgyb.co/s/XCMXd https://is.gd/dfR767 
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AboutMe https://about.me/redcarpetrunner https://mgyb.co/s/CRWkA https://is.gd/5JllaX 

Instapaper 
https://www.instapaper.com/p/re
dcarpetrunner https://mgyb.co/s/zyUlO https://is.gd/fdoVJF 

Disqus 
https://disqus.com/by/redcarpetr
unner/about https://mgyb.co/s/aGpiR https://is.gd/YHyziQ 

Medium 
https://medium.com/@redcarpetr
unner https://mgyb.co/s/CShjf https://is.gd/1ECvYo 

Facebook 
https://www.facebook.com/redca
rpetrunner https://mgyb.co/s/DpNVY https://is.gd/1UG1L9 

Instagram 
https://www.instagram.com/redc
arpetrunner https://mgyb.co/s/WvVFu https://is.gd/7Ddb5o 

Pinterest 
https://www.pinterest.com/redcar
petrunnernyc https://mgyb.co/s/LTCut https://is.gd/N5cKzE 

Yelp 
https://www.yelp.com/biz/red-car
pet-runner-new-york https://mgyb.co/s/eJyHe https://is.gd/Hc9ft5 

Pressadvantage 
https://www.pressadvantage.co
m/organization/red-carpet-runner https://mgyb.co/s/YqGok https://is.gd/pLKLV1 

Google Maps 
https://goo.gl/maps/geK7Z4YRA
UGWMjat5 https://mgyb.co/s/VxBgS https://is.gd/rCOtoc 

Google Maps 

https://www.google.com/maps/pl
ace/Red+Carpet+Runner/@40.7
44634,-73.98773,14z/data=!4m6
!3m5!1s0x89c259af411acef9:0xe
0432b47feb95a11!8m2!3d40.744
6338!4d-73.9877303!16s%2Fg%
2F11s0frdd7q?hl=en&entry=ttu https://mgyb.co/s/VSVoy https://is.gd/3C3AwX 

Thug URLs 

https://drive.google.com/drive/u/
0/folders/1l99A4DCvZwWExqY3
EbYUWLjWTbXPnqUP https://mgyb.co/s/FlRTm https://is.gd/yd1dNW 

MyMap 

https://www.google.com/maps/d/
embed?mid=1jwOjS2_voJdBlLz
o5zm3dm30evFViO0&ehbc=2E3
12F https://mgyb.co/s/riTfD https://is.gd/DzNZZC 
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