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Subscription Management Software For Small 
Business 
Fact: SaaS companies live and breathe  their customers. Subscriptions are at the heart of what 
they do, and billing is only  part of it. Good subscription management software recognizes this, 
and does so in ways that enable businesses to integrate their tech stacks, improve collection 
processes, and maximize efficiency. 
 Appropriate Subscriptions By using management software, SaaS companies are not only 
changing how billing is managed, but are also reaping benefits that can be felt throughout the 
organization.  
 1 Billing management is done in minutes  
 Subscription management software improves business and customer billing. On the customer 
side of the  
 equation, the advantage is consistency. Invoices are timely and accurate. No significant traces 
of human error were left. Jane Smith will never receive an invoice addressed to Jan Smith 
again.  
 According to Salesforce, 75% of customers believe consistency is one of the most important 
factors in their overall experience at their company, so much so that they turn to new vendors 
that don't exist. Of course, this isn't ideal for companies that value low churn. Billing  
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  is a task that can take weeks, but with the best subscription management software, it can be 
reduced to an afternoon or less. Not only is this important for the scalability of your recurring 
billing business, but it also allows your team members to focus on tasks that  have  the highest 
business impact.  

Software Subscription Management 
 Automation of manual processes has been proven to lead to savings of up to  50% per affected 
department. Using recurring billing software to handle customer subscriptions and payment 
processing offers many benefits for both your customers and your business.  
 Subscription management platforms can also facilitate the collection of overdue or unpaid bills. 
Manual dunning can be difficult. Especially if your billing department is already busy manually 
creating dozens of invoices. The  
 Subscription Management Tool allows you to:  
 Automated Credit Card Clerks. Delinquencies can often be traced back to credit card issues. 
About 20% of Americans have experienced credit card overdraft. Customers may be overdrawn 
when their card is charged. They intended to keep the subscription, but the payment was 
registered as 'unpaid', so it was activated. An automated credit card clerk solves this problem. 
Customers often don't need to know there is a problem. This strategy has been shown to save 
up to 75% of revenue that would have  been lost to churn. Automatic renewal of credit cards. 
Credit cards expire every 3-4 years. In this case, the customer may not think or want to 
manually update the card with each provider where the card is registered. Many subscription 
management tools work with map providers to  update this information automatically. 
Automated customer communications. Subscription management software also automates 
collection communications. Customers with outstanding bills will be sent an email or text 
notification directly with clear instructions on how to reinstate their account. The Dunning 
Management module also allows you to tailor notifications for each dunning round  to take into 
account the increasing urgency.  Improved reporting capabilities. A good subscription 
management system  also provides clear reports on who owes what and for how long. These 
reports help organizations identify problems and develop a collection management strategy that 
is directly tailored to their needs. easier to do. Pending payments can easily lead to  involuntary 
churn, a phenomenon that drives away customers who want to keep their subscriptions. Up to 
40% of churn is involuntary and leads to significant loss of revenue.  
 

Subscription Management Solution 
Not only is this expensive, it costs up to 5% of a company's annual revenue, but it can be 
avoided. Reliable subscription lifecycle management software addresses all  these issues by 
collecting revenue while managing customer subscriptions.  
 Subscription Management Software empowers your customers by providing them with a variety 
of self-service options that make it easy to customize and manage your subscriptions. About 
80% of customers will try to resolve product issues or adjustments themselves before contacting 
the company, but about 70%  prefer this to dealing with customer service.  



 Many subscription management services offer hosted sites that make it easy for organizations 
to  implement these portals. This not only benefits the majority of customers, but  also improves 
the overall customer experience.  
 When customers can solve simple problems on their own, businesses are better able to handle 
complex problems. It also allows you to better utilize your resources and provide a higher level 
of care to your customers. Reduced wait times and more personalized responses give your 
customers results they'll remember the next time they're asked for an update.  
 subscription management software improves data management by eliminating the need for 
manual re-entry. The error rate for manual data entry  is estimated to be around 1%. This is a 
seemingly insignificant number that can have serious consequences.  
 Subscription management technology can eliminate this entirely by integrating with the rest of 
the technology stack. Without  integration, data is manually (and sometimes verbally) 
exchanged between departments, creating opportunities for mistakes when someone needs the 
information.  
 

Subscription Management Software For Business 
 Integration makes data accessible across departments. Integrations can be built into anything 
from CRMs and ERPs to  payment gateways. Your subscription management software acts as a 
bridge, seamlessly routing your data wherever you need it. 
Apart from simple physical data, subscription management platforms also generate a large 
amount of organized physical data. This information can be channeled into productive means 
through auto-generated dashboards that are easily accessible by the departments that need it.  
Billing generation data helps us better understand our customers for marketing purposes.We 
can drive usage-based information that is essential for product development and provide 
calendar-based reports showing sales figures for any given day .  
Accessible reports enable departments to access  the information they need and implement it in 
an easy-to-understand and user-friendly way.  
It would be nice to have an automated invoicing and invoicing process. What a comprehensive 
subscription management system does better than provide is backup of your collections. 
Integrated data and reporting. Customer Approval.  
A good subscription management platform is like a vascular system, sending information where 
you need it, in an easily accessible and understandable format. This is very important for 
companies who value efficiency. 
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