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iNTUition Terms & Conditions

iNTUition is intended to be a safe and inclusive environment for all participants. You must
comply with the following guidelines to ensure that every hacker is given an equal
opportunity. All participants are required to obey these laws. Failure to do so will lead to
exclusion from the event and subsequent iterations.

COMPETITION RESTRICTIONS

Only entries started during the hackathon hours will qualify as valid. Those that contain code
written prior to the hackathon start time will be disqualified with an exception to publicly
available open-source code and libraries. Any form of plagiarism will be considered cheating
and will lead to disqualification. The iNTUition team reserves the right to disqualify teams for
all forms of cheating including those not explicitly mentioned above. Any misrepresentation
of your hack, intentional or accidental, will be considered cheating and will lead to immediate
disqualification.

ONLINE BEHAVIOUR

iNTUition 8.0 will be conducted online spanning multiple platforms, including Playground,
Discord, Zoom and more. You will be held accountable for any actions taken or messages
sent on event platforms. Inappropriate use of online platforms and tools, including any
interactions that are disrespectful or not in the spirit of the event, will lead to expulsion from
the event. A report button will be available to ensure that all participants adhere to the
guidelines.



HARASSMENT

Harassment includes but is not limited to inappropriate conduct, offensive behaviour, and
unbidden sexual attention. This includes any inappropriate verbal behaviour related to
orientation, gender, race, sexual, nationality, disability, age or religion. The iNTUition team
reserves the right to take actions, including issuing warnings and disqualifying, against
participant who do not abide by the appropriate conduct.

By submitting the form, you, the submitter of the form, will be indicating your consent
towards following the above T&Cs.

Photo Release

We, IEEE NTU Student Branch, will be taking photos and videos during iNTUition. Such
photos and videos may be used for the sake of future marketing by IEEE NTU Student
Branch. By submitting the form, you, the submitter of the form, will be indicating your
consent of such use to the IEEE NTU Student Branch.

Personal Data Protection Notice (PDPA)

We, IEEE NTU Student Branch, will be collecting, storing, and using all data collected as a
part of iNTUition in compliance with the Personal Data Protection Notice (PDPA). By
consenting, you, the submitter of the form, will be indicating your agreement to disclose such
data to the IEEE NTU Student Branch.

Distribution of Swag

Swag will be distributed to participants residing in Singapore based on certain conditions
which will be mentioned on hack day.


