
Ducky’s whole life has been on a boat. The salty fresh air, the rocking motion as they’re trying to
sleep… It’s nothing less than a dream come true! Ducky has sailed with many, many baos. They
adore it! They make new friends, and travel the world! While some baos like poor Tangerine get
seasick, Ducky is different. In fact, being away from the sea makes them a little homesick!
They’re a good friend, and since they’ve been on the sea so long, they’re a perfect bao to sail
with! They know how to handle seasickness. Cold? Well, they got plenty of blankets since they
know the sea gets cold at night! They’re a pro at throwing lifesavers, and always be sure their
bao friends who aren’t as skilled swimming wear a lifejacket. Safety first, of course!

The young sailor loves to sit on the deck at night, enjoying the motions of the ocean and the
vivid stars in the sky. They love to wake up early and say good morning to the fishies swimming
by. They feed some of the different fish that come by as well. They zoom around as they clean
the boat, making it sparkle just as bright as the stars the night before.

Once their little sea friends are satisfied, Ducky makes their way into the cabin to start breakfast.
They make delicious pancakes with honey drizzled on. They, of course, make enough for the
whole crew. A happy, full crew is the best crew, after all! Today is a special day, so they add
fresh cut strawberries to the pancakes as well! And a guilty pleasure of a bit of whipped cream.
The bear looks pleased, and sets the large table for the whole crew. They adore the praise they
get, and seeing everyone laughing and eating together. So the crew eats breakfast and dinner
together every day. It’s a tradition! Because, the crew to Ducky is like a big loving family.

At night, everyone gathers for their dinner feast, prepared by Ducky as well! They sing and
cheer, and drink honey lemonades until they get tummy aches! The bear takes care of them all
with a smile on their face. Gently pulling blankets over the ones that drank too much and fell
asleep. Helping those dizzy from the sea to their cabin. The little bear doesn’t complain. They
love nurturing others. It’s all in a day's work!


