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On successful completion of 
this unit the student can: 
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  R 

 
  P 

 
  M 

 
  D 

Context 
 
1.1​Use critical and contextual 

perspectives to initiate a 
creative media production 
project proposal. 

 
 

Redacted ☐ ☐ ☐ ☐ 

 
1.2​Use analysis and 

evaluation to clarify and 
develop ideas for a 
creative media production 
project proposal. 

 

Redacted ☐ ☐ ☐ ☐ 

 
Research 
 
2.1​Use research to support 

the development of a 
creative media production 
project. 

 

Redacted ☐ ☐ ☐ ☐ 

 
2.2​Use analytical and 

evaluative skills to develop 
creative solutions to realise 
a media production project. 

 

Redacted ☐ ☐ ☐ ☐ 

 
Problem solving 
 
3.1​Solve practical and 

technical problems within a 
creative media production 
project. 

 

Redacted ☐ ☐ ☐ ☐ 

​
 

Redacted ☐ ☐ ☐ ☐ 
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3.2​Solve theoretical problems 

within a creative media 
production project. 

 
Planning and production 
 
4.1​Demonstrate the ability to 

plan, organise and produce 
a creative media 
production project within 
an agreed time frame. 

 

Redacted ☐ ☐ ☐ ☐ 

 

 

 

 

 
Practical skills 
 
5.1​Demonstrate the 

exploration, adaptation and 
application of practical 
methods and skills in the 
realisation of a creative 
media production project.  

 

Redacted ☐ ☐ ☐ ☐ 

 

 

 

 

 
Evaluation and reflection 
 
6.1​Maintain evaluative and 

reflective records of the 
development of a creative 
media project. 

 

Redacted ☐ ☐ ☐ ☐ 

 

 

 

 

​
 
6.2​Use evaluative reflective 

skills to make decisions for 
a creative media 
production project. 

 

Redacted ☐ ☐ ☐ ☐ 

 

 

 

 
 
Presentation 
 
7.1​Explore strategies to 

present a creative media 
production project. 

 

Redacted ☐ ☐ ☐ ☐ 

 

 

 

 
​
 

Redacted ☐ ☐ ☐ ☐ 
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7.2​Present a creative media 

production project to a 
specified audience. 
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