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Antarctica is at the bottom of the earth where the south pole is.  
Antarctica is a Continent not a country even though it’s really big. 
 
 
Antarctica is a place where it is very cold and frizzy and not many 
animals live there. It is mostly Covered with Ice and snow. Penguins live 
there, it is their habitat and orcas live there too. Part of Antarctica is 
melting by the hot fiery sun, Antarctica is a desert but a  very different 
kind of one. A normal Desert is hot, covered in sand and has pyramids in 
a Desert, all kinds of deserts are Continents. Deserts are on the top of 
africa  
But Antarctica is Cold, Covered in ice and snow and is very in habitated. 
Antarctica is Seriously Dry. somewhere in Antarctica.  
Antarctica has some different places you can visit. You could maybe go 
to the South pole All the way in the middle of Antarctica. you might see 
some Penguins in their habitat somewhere in Antarctica. 
 
 
If you're wanting to go to Antarctica you will need some Special gear or 
Clothing, to keep you safe .You might need lots of winter Clothes to keep 
you very warm, you could get hot in Antarctica. You will also need 
waterproof pants, a Jacket and boots so you can stand in water and to 
keep you warm. It is very cold in Antarctica. There's no food except in 
the Southern Ocean. The best amount of days  you would survive is 
about 10 to 21 days. So you probably won’t want to go there. There are 
some flights that take you to Antarctica. But the real way to go there is 
on a boat. But you can still go to Antarctica even though it’s cold and all 
of the stuff. You might even pack a whole bunch of winter clothes. the 
more winter clothes you bring and wear the hotter you will be.  
 
 
There are lots of cool benefits and interesting facts about Antarctica, 



here are some of them. Antarctica is very cold and mostly covered in ice 
just right for penguins to slide on the slippery ice and catch fish in the 
Southern Ocean. At night time it gets a little bit colder so you’ll need 
more clothes to keep you warm. then in the morning it gets a little bit 
hotter. Antarctica is bigger than the United States of America and Europe  
Penguins only eat 3 kinds of food krill,fish and squid. They mainly eat 
fish but they also eat krill and fish sometimes. Antarctica is melting 
because of the heat in Spring and Summer. There is little rain in 
Antarctica so that’s why it is a desert. It’s the biggest desert on Earth.  
The name Antarctica is a Name for opposite of the North. There is a flag 
on Antarctica even though it’s a continent That are all the cool benefits 
and interesting facts I know about Antarctica 
 
 
You get bored when you go to Antarctica. Here are some things you can 
do if you are bored for 10 days. The first thing you can do in Antarctica is 
kayaking with whales. Kayaking is a canoe type of thing and it’s mainly 
used by Inut. Another thing you can do is if you see penguins it might be 
good to sit down and watch them slide on their bellies. You might find it 
quite interesting. You could also At night you can look at all the stars and 
make all the constellations you can make. There is also Another thing 
you can do in Antarctica you can go for a cruise if you come in a big boat 
and see all over Antarctica. It’s even more fun when your friends can  
spot other things that you can’t and tell you it might be something 
interesting. Another thing you can do is if you're on the edge of 
Antarctica and far away from the south pole  you can challenge yourself 
and walk all the way to the south pole. You can also hike up tall 
Mountains, you might even climb the tallest Mountain in Antarctica. You 
can go with your friends if they come with you and maybe when you get 
to the top you will see the whole of Antarctica. There is another fun thing 
to do in Antarctica. You can go scuba diving, you can dive into the water 
with all your friends underwater like a scuba diver, you might see an orca 
under the sea, and lots of others  that are some of the things you can do 
in Antarctica. 
 
 
Antarctica is a cool  continent to see because it’s interesting to look at 
penguins for the first time or orcas. And kayaking with whales and 
wearing lots  of clothes to make you warm.   


