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Privacy Policy

Our company aims to provide you with the best apps and games that will ensure you endless
fun. To us, your privacy is highly important and we would like you to take a few minutes and
revise our Privacy Policy.

Information We Collect

Our tendency is not to collect your personal and non-personal information. All permissions that
are requested are for application performance. Then again, it might happen that we collect the
previously mentioned information once you communicate with us. This will happen solely in the
situation when you contact us via mail which is listed on the bottom of this Privacy Policy. We
can guarantee that your e-mail will not be misused, forwarded nor used in any way.
Nevertheless, it is out of our reach whether the third parties who display interest-based ads will
gather and use your personal information. We are therefore not responsible for the actions
taken by those companies and people, for the possible content of their sites and also the use of
the information you provide to them. With using our Services you are agreeing to our Policy that
is explained here.

Third Parties Services

Our intention is to enable you free high quality apps and games that will make your day. With
that in mind we cooperate with a few providers who are allowed to display interest-based ads.
However, the connection to those sites does not signify our sponsorship of those companies nor
affiliation with those people. By accepting our Services and using our apps without selecting
opt-out options you are giving us your consent to transfer the data as stated. We are working
with third parties and advertisers who want to know how you interact with marketing content that
is provided to you. These advertising networks may use information logged from your device
using cookies, web beacons and other technologies to ensure that certain advertising is
presented within the application. The information collected may refer to the identification ID of
your mobile device and your mobile number.

Sharing content on Facebook, YouTube, Twitter and other sites

Personal and non-personal information from your profile will be accessible to third parties
(Social Networks and alike) once you share what you have been able to compose or what you
have achieved in an application or a game. If you select the option “allow”, “I agree”, or
something similar to this you will give your consent to the conditions in Privacy Policy which
you will have the opportunity to inspect. Control the way your data, such as use name, contact
information and the other from your profile, will be collected, stored as well as used. When you
share the content with Facebook, Google, YouTube or Twitter you will give them a chance to



obtain your personal information, and it is extremely important to know that you have the power
to limit what sort of data that would be. Get to know the way your personal data will be obtained
or stored by these Social Networks and bear in mind that different sites have access to
different information.

Use of Information by Our Partners

It is possible that applications might include third-party interest based ads which will lead to
temporarily uploading advertising into applications. They might attach the information gathered
from your device to the information gathered from other apps, websites, and afterwards build
profiles and transfer that to another provider. The provider might get information about you and
use it to provide you with the targeted ads. There are several third parties that we are
cooperating with and who are giving us a hand in bringing you advertisements and thus
enabling us to provide you the applications for free. Our network of third parties includes:

● AdColony - http://www.adcolony.com/privacy-policy

● Google Admob - https://www.google.com/intl/en/policies/privacy/

● ironSource - http://www.ironsrc.com/wp-content/uploads/2019/03/ironSource-Privacy-Policy.pdf

● AppLovin - https://www.applovin.com/privacy

● Appnext - http://www.appnext.com/policy/

● Chartboost - https://answers.chartboost.com/hc/en-us/articles/200780269

● Fyber - https://www.fyber.com/legal/privacy-policy

● Unity Ads - https://unity3d.com/legal/privacy-policy

Feel free to inspect and investigate the Privacy Policies of our partners that we have enlisted
above. This will clarify you the usage of your information. Changes are likely to occur in the
future regarded to the list of our partners as we might contact some additional third parties or
might replace some of the existing ones.

Security

Confidentiality of your personal information is our prime concern. However we would like you to
be aware that despite our best efforts, no security system can prevent all potential security
breaches. In other words, as hard as we try, we cannot guarantee you that third parties will not
obtain access to your personal and non-personal information.
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Children

We do not use our products to solicit information from any of our users, thus no personal
information will be gathered from children either.

Sensitive Information

We kindly ask you not to disclose any sensitive Personal Information. These might include
information that are in relation to your age, name, date of birth, racial or ethnic origin, political
opinions, religion or other beliefs, health or membership in past organizations. All those
proprietary pieces of information that could be misused are advisable not to be disclosed.

Changes to Policy

The Privacy Policy that is presented to you might undergo some changes due to updating. It is
highly recommended that you revise this page from time to time to keep yourself informed about
our privacy practices.

Opting Out of Marketing

If you wish, there is an option to opt out of interest-based ads. For all of you who choose this
opt-out option in your apps it will mean that your device ID will not be shared with the
advertisers for those interest-based ads. However, there are no guarantees concerning the
information provided prior to opting out. To achieve this you can turn on “Limit Ad Tracking” on
your iOSTM or “Opt Out of Interest-Based Ads” on AndroidTM. This decision is reversible by
clicking again on the same button. What does it mean to opt out? Selecting the opt-out option
designates that you may still be getting ads on your device, but unlike the previous ones, they
will not be interest-based since our partners will have only non-personal information of you. Our
parties are in obligation to comply with your choices and respect your wishes to opt out of
tracking. Follow directions listed below if you wish to opt out:

●
For iOS 7 or higher

Settings > Select Privacy > Select Advertising > Enable the “Limit Ad Tracking” setting

●
For iOS 6



Settings > Select General > Select About > Select Advertising > Enable the “Limit Ads
Tracking” setting

●
For Android with OS 2.2 and up and Google Play Services version 4.0 and up:

Open your Google Settings app > Ads > Enable “Opt Out of Interest-Based Advertising”

Contact Information

For any concerns that you might have feel free to contact us and we will do our best to clarify
any of your doubts. You can reach us at the following mail: latestphotomontage@gmail.com


