
Welcome Sequence For ‘Hunter Evolve’:    
 
Email 1: 
 
Subject Line- 10% less charge, 100% more SUCCESS! 
 
Welcome,  
 
As promised, here’s your 10% discount code off our range of Hunter products: 
 
ENTERCODE 
 
As you’ve probably already read on our website, which is obviously why you're here, at Roar 
Ambition we are dedicated to creating premium performance enhancing supplements to suit 
your growing needs, because we know the formulas to make you feel POWERFUL and 
CONQUER! 
 
Stay tuned for more upcoming exclusive content on the only range of performance 
enhancers you’ll ever need to feel strong and motivated.  
 
Stay Hunting, 
 
Roar Ambition. 
 
 
 
Email 2: 
 
Subject Line- Boosting testosterone was never this easy! 
 
So what makes Hunter Test the standard for all other testosterone supplements? 
 
We’ve created a supplement so distinctly potent and effective, our R&D team may have just 
discovered how to MAKE MEN! 
 
Combining only natural, non-GMO, testosterone boosting ingredients, Hunter Test contains a 
plethora of clinically proven mass builders and nutraceuticals to make you feel like you’re 20 
again! 
 
With 3000mg of the proven testosterone booster D-aspartic acid, or D-AA, making it the 
MOST concentrated supplement on the market, you’ll be more than well equipped to 
become the man you deserve to be.  
 
And to top it off, Hunter Test is made in F-D-A APPROVED facilities!  
 
So you can be rest assured no corners were cut in delivering this one of a kind T-booster to 
you.  



If you're wondering what nutraceuticals we used, Learn More to find out how they increase 
testosterone production and why we picked them. 
 
Stay Hunting, 
 
Roar Ambition.  
 
P.S. Want to hear what renowned fitness blog ‘Fitness Brain’ has to say about Hunter Test? 
Click Here to find out why it’s their supplement of choice.  
 
 
 
Email 3: 
 
Subject Line- You’ve tried the rest, now experience the best: Hunter Test.  
 
Our renowned testosterone booster is CHANGING LIVES! 
 
And it’s all because we’re seriously dedicated to delivering a high quality and genuinely 
impactful T-booster to the men who need it most.  
 
Hunter Test isn’t just an average ‘run of the mill’ supplement that fits the low standard for a 
testosterone booster, and believe us the market has been saturated with those, because  
mediocrity is not something we settle for at Roar Ambition.  
 
Our T-booster isn’t crammed with low concentrations of every testosterone boosting  
ingredient on the planet,  
 
Instead we’ve focused on delivering optimal amounts of specific nutraceuticals, which you 
learnt about in our previous email, to deliver actual RESULTS! 
 
So whilst you get stronger and more confident each month those who didn’t choose Hunter 
will fall back, continuing to lose testosterone and watching you conquer at ages they didn’t 
believe it to be possible. 
 
And unlike those other cheap “testosterone boosters” on the market, when you open a bottle 
of Hunter Test you won’t be faced with unpleasant smelling, oversized and hard to swallow 
placebo pills,  
 
You’ll be faced with our specially crafted muscle building, energy and libido enhancing 
MAGIC!  
 
Don’t believe us? 
 
Here’s what our customers have to say… 
 

https://www.hunterevolve.com/en-gb/hunter-test
https://fitnessbrain.co.uk/reviews/hunter-test/


“Your age doesn’t matter, it matters how you feel inside, and I honestly recommend Hunter 
Test to any man over 35. I think it’s never too late, it has worked for me, and it will work for 
you too” 
 
-Oscar/ 44 
 
“I found Hunter Test and decided to give it a go… I’m so glad I did ! After a few weeks of 
taking it I’ve noticed a boost in my mood, more energy and drive to hit the gym to ultimately 
get in my best ever shape… that’s my next job. And Hunter Test will help me get there” 
 
-DanMan 
 
 
“I’ve now been on Hunter Test for a few weeks and the benefits are starting to come 
through… I feel completely refreshed, like I’ve been revitalised. My lifts are bigger in the gym 
and I’m feeling stronger than ever. I’m not disappointed one bit. Thoroughly recommend 
guys” 
 
-Sam 
 
 
“What I really liked about Hunter Test was that it was made of all-natural ingredients, and it 
was all right there on the label. I decided to pull the trigger and give it a try, and I haven’t 
looked back since” 
 
-Behroz/ 47 
 
 
“I’m not hyperbolizing anything here, this stuff works. It really works. Never before have I had 
a drive like this. I wanted some extra motivation and drive to hit the gym and finally get 
shredded. I’m now going on runs and doing full body workouts with regularity; a lack of 
motivation is no longer an issue for me. I can exercise longer, and my libido has similarly 
been improved” 
 
-Daniel/ 21 
 
 
“Hunter Test has allowed me to get back to my old self, giving me more energy to enjoy time 
with my kids and I’ve even managed to lose a bit of weight!” 
 
-Scott/ 47 
 
Shop Now and join the community of men who are renewing their vitality and restoring 
themselves to their former greatness! 
 
Stay Hunting,  
 
Roar Ambition.  

https://www.hunterevolve.com/en-gb/hunter-test


 
 
 
Email 4: 
 
Subject Line- A smart fat burner?  
 
So you’ve heard of our Hunter Test, and maybe you’ve already invested in it because you’re 
one of the few people who realised its actual benefits. 
 
But sometimes boosting testosterone isn’t all you can do to feel strong and energised,  
 
We realised that alongside low T-levels, struggling to shed body fat is something which 
requires a lot of commitment and change to transform your life for the better so you can,  
 
 

●​ STOP your compulsive eating! 
 

●​ Prevent weight gain! 
 

●​ Tone your body and reveal the strong ripped physique waiting to be unleashed! 
 

●​ Feel more energised so you can utilise your body to the MAX! 
 

●​ Achieve the fitness goals you yearn to have but are struggling to get! 
 

●​ Become more successful and respected by your peers (A 2015 study shows thinner 
men earn 16% more money on average!) 
 
 

That's why, as usual, we’ve made this as MINIMAL as possible for you with our Hunter Burn. 
 
With our unrivalled formula containing 3000mg of Konjac Root, its significance in burning fat 
comes from glucomannan; a fibre which is also known to decrease cholesterol levels! 
 
Plus, we bet you’ve never heard of a fat burner that contains cayenne pepper! 
 
Utilising powerful thermogenics, the active ingredient in cayenne pepper is effective in 
raising your body temperature, which in turn increases your metabolic rate; allowing you to 
burn even more fat, especially during those tough workouts. 
 
And do we really have to mention it's made strict to cGMP and FDA guidelines again?! 
 
Check out the list of active ingredients we’ve used in the Hunter Burn for you to reap all the 
benefits from and feel the way you’ve always wanted to feel but couldn’t… 
 
Until you found us. 

https://www.hunterevolve.com/en-gb/hunter-burn


Stay hunting,  
 
Roar Ambition. 
 
P.S. Listen to what Paul and Xoan have to say about Hunter Burn, and how it helped them 
shed fat, without losing any muscle! 
 
 
 
Email 5: 
 
Subject Line- SERIOUS about FAT LOSS? Open this email, or don’t…. 
 
Slimming down to feel healthier, look better and perform stronger is a serious process and 
can’t be resolved by simply taking a ‘wonder’ pill.  
 
So here at Roar Ambition we’ve created a scientifically supported, unmatched formula to 
deliver a premium fat burner and help you take back control of your body! 
 
We really did our research when it came to this one, because fat loss is demanding, and 
sourced only the best quality natural fat burning ingredients to create the Hunter Burn!  
 
It doesn’t contain any artificial flavours, additives, preservatives, gluten or soy! And the sheer 
POTENCY of this formula is the only one of its kind (see if you can find another).  
 
And unlike other “fat burners” we use larger doses to meet your demands (180 capsules as 
compared to the standard 60-80 to be exact).  
 
All of this combined with our simple determination to help you shed body fat, lose weight and 
feel and look better, whilst preventing muscle loss is the reason all of our customers prefer 
Hunter Burn and are actually seeing results! 
 
Here’s what they have to say… 
 
 
“I've been taking Hunter Burn for 2 months now and I’ve already lost 16 pounds. If you’d 
have asked me 2 months ago if I’d be in the best shape of my life I would’ve 
laughed…Hunter Burn has helped cut all that excess body fat without compromising my 
muscle… JUST what I needed. Just take your tablets and let Hunter Burn do the rest.” 
 
-Josh 
 
 
“I’m just eating the meals I need to and have totally stopped snacking. My energy levels are 
also staying high, making workouts a little easier. My jeans fit a whole lot easier now. Maybe 
Hunter Burn has made it possible to finally stop overeating...?? Who knows, all I know is that 
this product has worked for me and does what it says.” 

https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=_F5oD-S71K0
https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=YkBsDeqHe7k


 
-Adam 
 
 
“My energy levels are high, and my motivation has risen- so I’m super happy I found this 
product!” 
 
-Taylor/ 27  
 
 
“I have been taking Burn by Hunter Evolve for 2 months, and I’ve already lost 17 pounds”  
 
-Raymond/ 44 
 
 
“I started taking Hunter Burn a few months ago to get one step ahead. Take it alongside 
working out daily and eating a moderately healthy diet. Feeling slimmer already and as I’m 
not one to step on the scales every day, I am definitely noticing positive changes in the 
mirror. Let’s keep going!” 
 
-Paul 
 
 
“I tried Hunter Burn to see if it could give my body a boost. And it did just that. After 3 months 
of supplementing alongside my own work I’m seeing a big change. I’ve lost 11 pounds and 
finally feel like my muscles are beginning to show.. It definitely helps cut down on excess 
body fat.” 
 
-Kyle 
 
 
“This product seems to have real potential in trimming off weight in critical areas. Obviously, 
it has been a short period, but I have noticed a difference.” 
 
-Robert/ 72 
 
 
Shop now and join these satisfied customers in looking and feeling like you’ve always 
wanted.  
 
Stay Hunting, 
 
Roar Ambition.  
 
 
 
Email 6: 

https://www.hunterevolve.com/en-gb/hunter-burn


 
Subject Line- Struggling to keep FOCUS? Try Hunter… 
 
Who’s got a terrible procrastination habit?  
 
But really, who lets it get in the way of progress? 
 
Well the first is painfully true for most of you, a lot of us suffer from procrastination, lack of 
focus, short attention spans, heightened anxiety and the list just goes on… 
 
And it’s largely due to the multiple stressors we face in our lives. Working jobs with 
strenuous demands whilst trying to keep sustained daily focus; balancing those stressful 
obligations at work with your family and making time for other things.  
 
Or maybe it's the ‘social media effect’. The modern world is a place of even greater demand, 
and trying to keep concentration has become increasingly harder with so many distractions 
and forms of fast moving content.  
 
But as for the second, the REAL question is how can you boost your brain power to 
PREVENT procrastination and optimise functionality to achieve success?  
 
Which is why we’re proud to be able to provide a solution…Hunter Focus!  
 
Hunter Focus was designed specifically to optimise these 6 aspects: 
 

1.​ Enhanced Memory  
2.​ Greater Focus  
3.​ Elevated Mood 
4.​ Increased Energy 
5.​ Boosted Creativity  
6.​ Optimised learning  

 
By harnessing the latest understanding on mental enhancement, Hunter Focus unlocks your 
cerebral potential. 
 
This smart cognitive enhancer is the choice of experts! 
 
Click Here to watch Greg Gostincar, biohacker, nootropic researcher, productivity expert and 
founder of Youtube channel ‘Your Inception’ review our Hunter Focus! 
 
Stay Hunting,  
 
Roar Ambition.  
 
 
 
Email 7: 

https://www.youtube.com/watch?v=8SewsAzUTDQ&t=377s


 
Subject Line- This secret…once the preserve of political leaders and CEOs, is now 
within your reach! 
 
Want to know the secret?  
 
Well, actually it’s more of a formula, 
 
More importantly, it’s our fully transparent formula of a natural nootropic made specifically for 
high performing individuals.  
 
And it’s packed with 20, research backed, key ingredients proven to improve memory 
retention, increase happiness, decrease anxiety, support brain activity and deliver 
unbreakable concentration, 
 
All working together to ensure you remain at the top of your game, and are mentally 
prepared to tackle the professional world so you can make better choices and solve complex 
problems. 
 
Too many other nootropic brands contain a proprietary blend of unproven ingredients. You 
either don't know what you're putting in your body, or that which you are putting in is 
ineffective, 
 
So if there were ever a nootropic that NEEDED to be FDA approved…it’s this one!  
 
That’s why we used clinical grade nutraceuticals to deliver you the Hunter Focus, 
 
A product renowned by our customers. 
 
Here’s what they have to say,  
 
I've tried over 50+ nootropic stacks over a number of years. Hunter Focus definitely seems 
to be one of the best out there. They have developed a great nootropic formula. 
 
-Greg Gostincar, Biohacker, nootropic researcher and productivity expert. Founder of Your 
Inception 
 
Why did I choose Hunter Focus? I needed something to increase my concentration at work 
–as a project manager it can get quite stressful and there’s no time to drop the ball! First 
month down and I’m feeling better than ever. I no longer get those meeting nerves or 
distracted by those never ending calls and emails… (no stress, they'll get answered 
eventually). I’m on a roll and I plan to stay that way. 
 
-Terry 
 
I’ve been taking the supplement for at least 4 months now and have experienced some great 
improvements in terms of my focus levels, attention and mood. I used to struggle to remain 
calm in stressful situations and my anxiety would be through the roof. With Hunter Focus, I’m 



able to maintain a positive outlook. I can’t recommend it enough. 
 
-Jacob 
 
As a father to 3 kids and with an office job that I seem to run away with sometimes, it can be 
hard to switch off from work. Honestly… I needed something natural and effective to help me 
switch my focus. I tried a bit of meditation but then found Hunter Focus to help me relax and 
prioritise. My mental energy is so much better and I no longer let stressful situations get to 
me 
 
-John 
 
Shop Now and discover the key to modern day success at both work and home.  
 
Stay Hunting,  
 
Roar Ambition.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

https://www.hunterevolve.com/en-gb/hunter-focus


 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 

 
 
  
 
 
 
  


