
Portrait of a Graduate:  2 year outlook  
Grade 1 

 K 1st 

Adaptive 
Perseverance 

Students will take a risk 
and make an effort to 
complete a 
developmentally 
appropriate social task. 

Students will take a risk 
and make an effort to 
complete grade level 
appropriate tasks in 
multiple ways. 

Responsibility 

Students will be 
responsible for their 
personal well-being 
(hygiene), personal 
belongings, and class & 
school materials. 

Students will be able to 
recognize that their actions 
affect others. 

Critical Thinking 

Students will ask 
questions and work 
together to gain 
understanding in academic 
or social situations with 
adult support. 

Students will ask on topic 
questions and work 
together to gain 
understanding of 
academic and/or social 
situations. 

Global Citizenship 

Students will demonstrate 
a willingness to try new 
things and take a risk that 
will lead to reaching a 
goal. 

Students will be open to 
alternate ideas other than 
their own. 

Learner's Mindset 

Students will initiate, join in 
and sustain positive 
interactions with a partner. 

Students will initiate, join 
in, and sustain positive 
interactions in a small 
group (up to 4 students). 

Collaboration 

Students will engage in 
guided conversations and 
add on-topic and 
interesting comments with 
small and large group. 

Students will engage in 
guided conversations and 
ask on-topic questions in a 
small and large group. 

Communication 

Students will participate 
cooperatively and 

constructively in a group 
situation with adult support 

despite differences. 

Students will participate 
cooperatively in adverse 

classroom situations 
despite differences. 

 


