
Top Three Ways to Create a Roku Channel 
 

 
 
Are You a Material Designer or a Coder? 
 
A lot of potential Channel Publishers wouldn't have the time neither the persistence-- neither in 
some cases, the sources-- to discover to establish a channel this way. In fact, I've uncovered 
that many ambitious Channel Publishers are NOT programmers at all, shape or type-- many are 
content creators, and material designers don't have the time to find out exactly how to create 
Roku Channels from the ground up. They 'd much instead be doing what they do best-- 
developing web content. 
 
Since that initial channel, I've established and released numerous channels over the years. The 
code itself hasn't changed (much), only the numerous procedures by which we code and also 
develop channels has actually transformed. Various software application and also SaaS 
(Software as a Service) items have actually considering that come into play (supposedly) 
making channel advancement easier for the Do-It-Yourselfer, however also for coders like me, 
they can often be time consuming and expensive to discover. Some programs have reoccured, 
others have stood the test of time-- as well as are truly terrific items for establishing channels-- 
however once more, there's that learning curve, which time aspect, and that power aspect that 
enter into producing them. For me, it's what I do. For TV Channel Pros, it's what they do. For 
you, it's most likely not how you wish to spend your Saturday afternoon. 
 
creating a roku channel 
 
The Five C's of Roku Channels 
 

https://tvchannelpros.com/


If you TIN diy, I would certainly suggest doing it. You may also intend to think about taking my 
brand-new Do-It-Yourself Roku channel workshop. It will certainly be an enjoyable as well as 
fulfilling experience to lastly get it ideal and also see your ended up Channel on the 
TELEVISION screen. Doing-It-Yourself CAN be costly, nevertheless. In addition to the time and 
energy, you'll require the vital parts that enter into every Roku Channel. I call these the Five C's 
of Roku Channels: 
 
1. Idea-- this is your CONCEPT for your Channel, it includes the logo design, graphics, format 
as well as design aspects of your channel that make it appealing to audiences. This is the 
ENJOYABLE part of creating your Channel. 
 
2. Code-- this is the actual programming (as in computer system programming, not television 
programming) for your Channel. It includes the channel code along with the channel "feed" that 
needs to be produced for your Channel. (The feed is code that delivers your material to your 
channel from your Content Delivery Network (CDN), both of which I talk about following.) The 
channel code have to be written in Roku's exclusive BrightScript and also the channel feed need 
to after that be written in either MRSS XML or JSON. This is the TECHNICAL part of creating 
your channel. 
 
3. Material-- this probably goes without stating, yet your web content is the video clip content 
you intend to disperse using your Channel. You should currently have that. (I'm mosting likely to 
inform you where to obtain more for FREE in a couple of moments.) Web content should 
gathered, posted, encoded, after that links must be generated for both video clip and 
screenshots, then those links need to be added to the code (over), and after that titles, 
summaries, durations and also various other metadata in most cases have to be added as well. 
This procedure is called, "Content Consumption" as well as it is the most TIME-CONSUMING 
part of creating and launching your Channel. Beyond the coding, most of the WORK will 
certainly be in Material Intake, connecting, etc., moving forward. 
 
4. Content Delivery Network (CDN)-- this is an unique web server on which your material is kept 
As Well As from which it is streamed to your Channel. For many, this can be the biggest 
expense. A CDN is like webhosting, however NOT. You can not use typical webhosting to shop 
and also offer your video web content to a Roku Channel. You TIN NOT connect your YouTube 
videos and offer them from YouTube to your Channel, either. If you could, after that this would 
all be a great deal more affordable to do. However you can not. As well as it's not. Though Roku 
as well as Connected TELEVISION usage "Internet Procedure (IP)" to stream content, they 
simply can not stream directly from the Web. (There's a lengthy and also technological solution 
to this that is most likely beyond the scope of this book.) Rather, you require to utilize a CDN 
that is developed especially for streaming to Connected Tv platforms. The CDN alone can cost 
anywhere from a number of hundred to a number of countless bucks just to establish, and then 
most of the times there's month-to-month fees and BANDWIDTH fees. If you're 
Doing-It-Yourself, this is one of the most COSTLY part of developing and releasing your 
Channel. 



 
5. Commitment-- Once you have all of the above in position, one of the most IMPORTANT part 
of developing and also launching your Channel is making the COMMITMENT to manage it, 
keep it and upgrade it regularly. You can throw a Channel up on the platform and also never 
ever touch it again, and you will certainly still obtain visitors-- a minimum of once or twice 
anyway. They'll visit your channel the very first time, surf your material and maybe discover 
something to see. Then they'll return a few days or a week or a month later on to see what's 
new. If there's absolutely nothing new, they probably will not return once more. The TRICK to an 
effective Roku Channel is to keep your web content MOVING; to keep it updated and also fresh, 
regularly. That takes commitment. 
 
If all of that appears very easy enough to you, then I completely recommend you attempt 
Doing-It-Yourself. I'll even recommend THREE programs right here that will certainly aid: 
 
Roku Direct Author 
 
Roku offers its own, totally-free channel-building system available at http://developer.roku.com. 
You merely sign-up and follow the directions to develop and also release your very own 
channel. It's all window-driven, much like including an item to eBay. You offer your Channel a 
title, you include summaries, you pick shades, upload logo designs (in the called for sizes and 
formats) and so on. Nonetheless, it does have some obvious challenges for the newbie Channel 
Author 
 
Beginning with Roku Direct Author. 
 
Initially, you will certainly still need your own Content Delivery Network (CDN)-- again, this can 
set you back anywhere from a number of hundred to several countless dollars, plus monthly 
charges as well as data transfer in many/most situations-- OR you can utilize TELEVISION 
Channel Pros's Web content Shipment Solution (CDS) which is a much less-expensive choice 
to pricey CDNs. TV Channel Pros CDS gives the very same top quality of service as well as 
trusted streaming as the more costly CDNs however at a portion of the expense, beginning at 
just $12.95 a month, relying on just how much content you have to serve, without additional 
bandwidth charges. 
 
Next Off, Roku Direct Publisher needs every channel to have its own channel "feed." This is a 
different piece of coding that gives instructions to the CDN (or CDS) above regarding what video 
content to reveal and also where. You'll need to compose your feed in either MRSS XML or 
JSON. Then you'll require an area to ORGANIZE your feed. (The feed can really be hosted on 
regular web hosting, whatever that costs you.). 
 
The Feed File Challenge. 
 



Developing a feed documents is where most aspiring Do-It-Yourselfers struck a wall surface. 
Unexpectedly, the "easy method" to developing a channel ends up being even more intricate 
and also several quit. Never ever be afraid however, due to the fact that TELEVISION Channel 
Pros now uses custom-made MRSS XML as well as JSON Feed Templates that you can utilize 
(starting at simply $49.95), together with simple-to-follow directions and tech assistance to aid 
you get your feed right. You merely copy-and-paste your content web links into the feed file 
design template, include titles, descriptions, and so on, for every video clip, and BOOM, you 
have a Roku-Ready feed for your Channel. TELEVISION Channel Pros will certainly also 
ORGANIZE your feed file for a nominal monthly charge. 
 
Expense of Using Roku Direct Publisher. 
 
Done in, provided you have your channel logo and also graphics to start, establishing a channel 
with Roku Direct Author (cost-free), plus TV Channel Pros CDS service, their custom-made 
MRSS XML or JSON feed, and also holding for your feed, you're taking a look at just $73 a 
month to introduce Do-It-Yourself, not consisting of the time and power as well as resources that 
go into ingesting your content to the CDN, or right into managing, preserving and updating your 
Channel each and every month. 
 
Immediate TV Channel. 
 
Another excellent device for the Roku Channel Do-It-Yourselfer is Immediate TV Channel 
(ITVC)-- http://www.instanttvchannel.com. This is a "cloud-based" Roku advancement service 
that sets you back $49.95 a month. I've personally used it for a number of channels and I enjoy 
it. It supplies better flexibility in creating your channel. You can create various designs, you 
promptly incorporate advanced performance, you can incorporate even more marketing streams 
than you can with Roku Direct Author, and also more. 
 
With ITVC, you may locate the setup part is a little challenging and also involved than with Roku 
Direct Author, however ITVC makes the "feed" part a lot easier by doing that work for you. As 
opposed to needing to code your video material directly into an MRSS XML or JSON feed, ITVC 
produces and maintains the feed immediately. You simply add your video clip titles and also 
summaries, as well as your video web links and screenshot links right into ITVC's Interface, as 
opposed to right into a code file, as well as outcomes are instantaneous. (For this reason the 
name, "Instantaneous TELEVISION Channel."). 
 
You Do Not Required a Feed Data. 
 
With ITVC, you will not require a feed file, yet you'll still require holding for it and for the various 
code data ITVC immediately creates and also updates for your channel. With ITVC you do not 
actually have a selection for that since it requires you to utilize Amazon AWS, which incidentally, 
is totally-free for the very first year and then $1-- 10 a month thereafter, relying on just how 
much traffic your channel gets. With ITVC, you'll still need a Web content Delivery Network 



(CDN), and also once more, your ideal as well as least-expensive choice for that would certainly 
be TV Channel Pros Content Distribution Solution (CDS) starting at just $12.95 a month. 
 
Expense of Using ITVC. 
 
All in, the expense to introduce a Roku Channel making use of ITVC ($ 49.95/ month), Amazon 
AWS (totally free for one year) as well as TELEVISION Channel Pros Material Shipment Service 
(CDS) can be as low as $63 a month. Once more, similar to Roku Direct Author, that does not 
include the moment as well as energy and also sources that enter into ingesting your web 
content, or into handling, maintaining and upgrading your Channel each month moving forward. 
 
Channel Testing and Approval. 
 
With both of these remedies-- Roku Direct Publisher as well as ITVC-- the channel testing and 
approval procedure can take anywhere from one to six weeks. (As well as nobody ever really 
knows precisely the length of time.) So be sure to take that right into consideration when 
identifying your channel's launch as well as promotional routine. 
 
A Faster, Easier Remedy is on the Following Page. 
 
Remember THE MAJORITY OF THE FUNCTION (that is, the "labor,") involved in creating, 
launching and also keeping a Roku Channel depends on Content Ingestion and Channel 
Administration. Prior to you determine to Do Everything Yourself, you have to stop and believe 
how much your time is actually worth to you. If you have the moment as well as the persistence 
to do it, and also to learn exactly how to make use of the above programs, by all means, do it. 
Otherwise, below's a much FASTER and EASIER means to create and also launch your very 
own Roku Channel, no matter your spending plan. Time- as well as energy-wise, this is 
definitely your least-expensive alternative:. 
 
TV Channel Pros Complete Roku Channel Program. 
 
TV Channel Pros supplies three channel plans. When thinking about which strategy is right for 
you, take into consideration the amount of time that would actually enter into ingesting as well 
as creating web links for each and every of your videos, after that literally connecting them into 
your channel code, including titles, descriptions, screenshot web links, etc. You'll swiftly see why 
each strategy is a large amount in relation to the quantity of video clip material and work 
entailed with each-- and also on top of that, THEY do all the help you on a recurring, 
month-to-month basis, as-needed. 
 
There's simply NO much better method to establish and also release a Roku Channel. Where it 
can commonly take 1 to 6 weeks for approval with the other services, with TELEVISION 
Channel Pros, you can see your new channel accepted in as little as 7 days. 
 


