
Heritage Trail

We’ll work to save the last few remaining heritage gems that were and are still synonymous within
Valletta, these iconic gems should be preserved and given all kinds of assistance to thrive and survive.

We as a community propose a 'Heritage Trail' to the Government to preserve and promote precious
cultural treasures that have shaped the identity of our City over the years. Here is a step-by-step guide on
how to do this:

1. Research and Planning: Cultural Identification: a comprehensive list of local cultural sites,
landmarks, and artefacts that are significant and at risk of being lost.

Historical Significance: documentation of the historical and cultural significance of each site. Including
information about their history, cultural context, and any notable events associated with them.

2. Community Support and Commitment: Involvement of the local community, cultural organisations,
historians, and experts. This may include petition signatures or letters of support from the community and
families of these businesses.

3. Authorities: Local Government officials, cultural Authorities, and national heritage preservation
agencies. With their help a map can be created as a guideline that connects these cultural sites.
Accessibility, distance, and any natural features that the Public Authorities can improve the experience of
all of these will be considered.

4. Tourism and the Economic Impact: The Heritage Trail will benefit the local economy through
increased quality tourism and cultural awareness. This will guarantee such unique gems to continue to
thrive. Unfortunately every Government and every Council has not been fully committed to helping these
aspects of heritage that have been passed down from generation to generation.

5. Additional Privacy Concerns: Every area of Valletta forms part Historical value, whilst we do
appreciate that large interest and promotion of our city we do wish to address persistent concerns
delivered to us by residents, and implement sets of regulations which Tour Groups would need to respect
in order to minimise disruption within residential areas such as lowering down loudspeakers, minimise
overcrowding of pavements followed by respecting private limits of each resident.

6. Advertisement and Incentives:We insist that every authority, department, event will be committed to
advertisement and creating special funds such as maybe start-up funds or even occasional voucher
systems amongst the locals and visitors of the locality without the financial burden or sacrifice of these
icons

The Importance of NGOs and the UNESCO Title
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Interest entities are always welcome but we would like to have the main NGOs incorporated within the
Local Council to have the UNESCO Title fully approved and protected.


