
 

Goo Gel 

Summary: 
Transformative that gives you gel skin and goo hair and adds gooey/lubricated as flags for 
penis/vagina. 

Item Info: 

Stats 
Max Stacks: 9  
Short name: Goo Gel 
Long Name: Goo Gel 
 
Description: A jar containing a rich amount of viscous gel. 
 
Sometimes slimes who's overfed will leave behind excess goo if they feel their biomass has 
grown too large and cumbersome. Alchemists who discovered this trait would refine the residue 
into various products, like this moisturizing gel. 
 
The bottle has a small label that reads: 
Apply in small doses. Avoid consumption. 
May cause: Excessive lubrication, damp hair, softness of skin. 
 
​
 
​
Value: 
150 Electrums 
 
 
 

 
​

 



 

Gel Skin 
Tooltip: Moisture is good for your skin, right?  
 
You take out the jar of goo and pour a rich amount of it into your hand, before you begin to 
massage it onto your [pc.skin], making sure you're thoroughly lubricated. Speaking of lubricated, 
did you know that in terms of male human and female pokemon breeding, vaporeon is the most 
compatible pokemon for humans? Not only are they in the field egg group, which is mostly 
mammals, vaporeon are an average of 3"03' tall and 63.9 pounds.  
 
This means they're large enough to be able to handle human dicks, and with their impressive 
base stats for hp and access to acid armor, you can be rough with one. Due to their mostly 
water based biology, there's no doubt in my mind that an aroused Vaporeon would be incredibly 
wet, so wet that you could easily have sex with one for hours without getting sore. They can 
also learn the moves attract, baby-doll eyes, captivate, charm, and tail whip, along with not 
having fur to hide nipples, so it'd be incredibly easy for one to get you in the mood. With their 
abilities water absorb and hydration, they can easily recover from fatigue with enough water. No 
other pokemon comes close to this level of compatibility. Also, fun fact, if you pull out enough, 
you can make your vaporeon turn white. 
 
<b>You've now got gel skin</b> 
 
 
 
 
​

 



 

Goo Dick 
 
You take the jar of goo out of your backpack and experimentally dip a few fingers into it. The 
slime feels pretty slick and easily coats your digits, which gives you an idea. What better way to 
enjoy the gel than to use it as lubrication?  
 
You take off your [pc.gear] and pour a rich amount of the ooze into your hand. Then you begin 
to strike your [pc.cock] to full mast, carefully applying the gel, while you think about something 
hot. It's only natural that your thoughts take you to Flareon, which is objectively the hottest 
Pokemon. Flareon is the definition of smoking, and with the highest attack stat among 
eeveelutions, passionate is an understatement! She'll be 'in heat' until her flames are thoroughly 
doused. If her insides are a furnace, her womb is a crucible just waiting to get filled. With low 
HP, defence, and a x2 weakness to ground, rock, and water, you'll finish her with no problem. 
But what she lacks in stamina, she makes for with persistence. With her abilities Flash Fire and 
Guts to raise her attack, she'll want even more.  
 
Don't be afraid, this loyal Pokemon won't burn you, she can control her internal temperature so 
she'll always be just right. And if you still can't stand the heat, try spending time together in the 
water, I guarantee things will get steamy. She will melt your mind, and your dick! With this one, 
you'll never have a cold night. Her fluff was made for cuddling, and as a bonus, you'll never pay 
for heating or hot water again. She'll even cook your food. And pyrokinesis? You could play 
around in the Himalayas for hours! 
 
<b>You've now got a goo dick.</b> 
 
​
​
​
 

​
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Goo Pussy 
Things might get messy for what you had in mind, so you take off your [pc.gear] to give yourself 
unrestricted access to your [pc.pussy]. That done, you bring out the jar of goo and pour a 
generous portion into your hand, before you start to smear it across your pubic mound. It feels 
quite delightful, like using a mending gel, and a nice coolness spreads across your pussy. Just 
like the delightful chill you can get from a Glaceon. Which in fact outclasses any other 
Eeveelutions. Both genders, too. 
 
Let me explain. Glaceon is 2 feet and 7 inches tall in height, giving it the perfect composure to 
fuck. It weighs approximately 57.1 pounds, giving it a small enough weight to move around 
during fucking, but also enough to not feel too light or too heavy when you're using your dick on 
it. Glaceon's stat spread is also incredibly versatile for sex, with incredible Defense and Special 
Defense. It has lackluster Attack, but the best part is its Special Attack. You'll see why later. As 
an ice type, having such good defenses is incredibly rare.  
 
You also might be thinking, "but your dick would freeze inside of its puss-puss!" This is not true! 
Here is its Pokédex entry from Pokémon Sun, circa 2016. "It can control its body temperature at 
will. This enables it to freeze the moisture in the atmosphere, creating flurries of diamond dust." 
Glaceon can control its body temp at will, so if you don't want your dick to be frozen, you can 
create the perfect environment for dicking it down by telling it to change its temperature! This 
way, you can fuck it in so many different ways, temperatures, and more!  
 
Now onto its moves, which are also incredibly useful for sex. By leveling up, it learns Helping 
Hand. This allows it to increase your fucking power by double, increasing your pleasure times 
two! It also learns Bite, meaning it can get freaky and tune to whatever shit you like in the bed. 
Best of all, it can use MIRROR COAT. This means whenever you cum, it can double back the 
pleasure like a special attack, meaning you'll feel all the pleasure IT had during sex times TWO! 
Combine this with Helping Hand and you'll be turned into a human cum nozzle! Glaceon also 
learns Barrier, which if used just thrice, turns it into a massively defensive tank, so it can take 
physical attacks for days, literal fucking days! It can also use Hail. Now, if you use it outside, it 
will Hail outside. Go back inside and the Hail won't affect you! Best of all, combine the Hail with 
Glaceon's ability Ice Body, and it will gradually replenish its Health Points during a hailstorm! 
This means it will NEVER fucking stop enduring all your "hits," so you can fuck it over and over 
and over, combining this with Barrier, and you could probably fuck it for 24 hours straight, if not 
more!  
 
It also learns Baby Doll Eyes, Charm, Captivate, and Yawn, allowing it to get itself right in the 
mood, along with you too! It even learns Fake Tears, Covet, and Tickle, allowing you to roleplay 
with it if you're in the mood. It even learns Stored Power, meaning if it uses enough Barriers, it 
can release all of the Defensive energy it has into, you guessed it, fucking SPECIAL ATTACK!!! 
And with its absolutely GODLY special attack stat, you'll be drowning in waves of pleasure due 
to this attack! And it doesn't get rid of the Barrier boosts, so as long as you have enough ethers, 
it can do this over and over WHILE you're fucking it!  



 

 
Hell, it even learns attract, which makes you fall so deeply in love with it that you'll be in a trance 
of fucking! It can take charge with that as well and use your love to make it fuck it how IT wants! 
Which means it's not just pleasurable for you, it's also pleasurable for your Glaceon! It even 
learns Aurora Veil, which in the Hail, protects it even fucking MORE from taking too much 
damage! Combine this with Ice Body and Barrier and you can fuck it for decades without either 
of you ever getting tired! 

 



 

Butt 
 
Things might get messy for what you had in mind, so you take off your [pc.gear] to give yourself 
unrestricted access to your [pc.butt]. That done, you bring out the jar of goo and stick a few 
fingers into it, making sure they're properly coated before you bring them up again. Now that 
you're all greased and ready, you can put your plan into motion. 
 
You gently spread your cheeks with one hand, while the other still covered in slime, start to 
spread it around your pucker. The sensation of the pleasant grease makes you think of the peak 
of sexuality that is a male vaporeon. Those long slippery dicks. They have full mobility control 
with like a tentacle are the perfect ass filler for the ultimate in deep reaching experience nothing 
else could possibly provide. Naturally lubed at all times due to their aquatic hydrodynamic 
nature, you can pull off anywhere to the side of the road, or go into a public restroom at the 
beach. Get each other aroused, and have the fuck of a lifetime. The extraordinary squishiness 
of the Vaporeon alone rubbing against you would be enough to lose yourself in pleasure as it 
simply mounts you. Let alone with that perfect tool of pleasure slipping into you, its ability to 
snake around your bends and its perfect length make it seem that a Vappy dick was made 
specifically for your booty.  
 
Enjoy the feeling of being completely filled while also being able to see it if you have a tight 
tummy. And that’s only the dick. Due to having internal balls, they’re much bigger and pack a lot 
more cream to load you up with, along with having muscles around them to make sure every 
drop comes out while also being a lot more powerful than any external balls could ever hope to 
achieve, giving you a deep, complete filling to rock your world to your literal core, and beyond. 
There’s still more though. Due to having a thick, powerful tail connected from their back and 
front, that means all their fun stuff is on the front and easy to access. Meaning, if you were even 
comfortable with having your dick point backwards (takes some training), you can be fucked, 
while also fucking your Vappy at the same time! Me-owth, that’s fucking right! But, but, but!  
 
There’s still fucking more! Like, holy fuck, male Vaps are the gods of fuck. While you’re fucking 
your male Vappy, possibly while also being fucked by him, their booty is on their tail, at the base, 
which is the thickest part, because that’s where the biggest muscles are. This means that while 
your dick is in there, it’s being fucking massaged, better than even a vag could achieve! Agh! It 
should be fucking illegal because how amazing male Vaps are for fuck! ​
​
​

 



 

Goo Hair 

You take a handful of the goo from the jar and begin to rub it in your head. It goes surprisingly 
smoothly, and you enjoy the sensation of the gel spreading across your [pc.hair], bringing a 
soothing, cool sensation. It's at moments like these that you ponder over how Umbreon weights 
approximately 60 pounds, or around 27 kilograms, and is 3'3'' tall (About a meter), making it not 
only large enough to appropriately handle human genitalia, but also light enough to easily be 
lifted, and promptly set back down repeatedly. Its relatively small size would also prove a tight 
entry, which is always a good thing.  

Umbreon also boasts an extremely impressive defensive stat spread. With its combination of 
very high HP, Defense, and Special Defense stats, it can take a great pounding and come back 
for more! Its ability, Inner Focus, allows it to keep slamming attentively, without getting fatigued. 
Umbreon also has access to the ability Synchronize, which allows it to share its current status 
with you, meaning you will receive all of the pleasure it feels COMBINED with all the pleasure 
you're getting from pounding this perfect breedable Pokémon.  

Umbreon also has the capability of seeing perfectly in pitch-black darkness, allowing it to 
effectively attend a midnight fornication session. Even if you do manage to drain Umbreon's 
energy with all the furious thrusts, it can recover very quickly with its access to the move 
Moonlight. Its black fur is also a giant positive attribute, allowing all the excretions you make to 
be easily seen all over its body. 

A great fun fact, Umbreon can excrete toxins in its sweat, which would in turn soak into your 
member and swell it up, making it even more sizable and sensitive. This would not only 
enhance the experience for you, but for your Umbreon as well (Which with Synchronize, ends 
up pleasing you exponentially more). Umbreon's wide movepool also supports the hypothesis 
that Umbreon is the best Pokémon to breed with. It can learn Payback, which doubles in power 
after the Pokémon is hit, meaning Umbreon will throw it back twice as hard as normally if you're 
hitting it good.  

Umbreon can also learn Guard Swap; it could give YOU it's insane durability, and go crazy on 
you all night with your now massive endurance. Speaking of endurance, Umbreon also has 
access to Endure, making it practically immune to fatigue, it will always have energy left over. 
Charm is also within Umbreon's movepool, letting it be extremely seductive towards you, easily 
getting you in the mood.  



 

Umbreon can also use Taunt, in turn making you ONLY able to to attacking moves such as 
Slam, Pound, etc; none of that foreplay shit, right into the action. It also has access to Sleep 
Talk, giving it the ability to not only give consent in its sleep, allowing access to any of its ports 
and any time, but also move in it's sleep, making it an effective 24/7 fuckmate. Umbreon still has 
even more great moves that good to have while smashing, such as Quick Attack, allowing swift 
slams and bounces, which can have even greater power if Umbreon uses Curse beforehand. 
Curse would also raise Umbreon's defense, making it able to take powerful thrusting for almost 
any duration.  

Looking back, Umbreon's slightly small size ensures a gorilla grip cavity and easy physical 
manipulation. Its ungodly bulk allows it to take poundings for hours on end and resume after 
recovering with moonlight (Which works even better when it's sunny). It's access to the abilities 
Inner Focus and Synchronize allow it to unwaveringly throw it back and add all of its pleasure 
onto yours, effectively making it twice as amazing as any other Pokémon, or even FOUR 
TIMES, factoring in the doubled power of payback of course.  

All of this information in combination with its extremely useful movepool in the world of 
intercourse makes Umbreon the Pokémon most qualified to breed with humans; able to take 
dick of any shape, any size, in any position easily for extensive periods of time, while having the 
ability to return for even more mere seconds later. 

 



 

Lubricated Dick 
 
Things might get messy for what you have in mind, so you swiftly strip out of your [pc.gear]. 
That done, you bring out the jar of goo and pour a generous portion into your hand, while you 
begin to stroke [pc.cock12b|your [pc.cocks] until it stands ready at full mast.|one of your 
[pc.cocks] until it stands ready at full mast.|your [pc.cocks] to hardness, alternating between 
different members to speed up the process.] Then you begin to apply the slime. 
 
While you do so, you think about how there's a debate between Vaporeon and Umbreon and 
which is better for being compatible between humans but there's a pokemon that's possibly 
even better. as funny as this may sound it's ANOTHER Eeveelution, it's Sylveon to be exact. 
Sylveon weighs 51.8 Pounds or roughly 23.5 kilograms and is 3'03 tall, so they are most 
defiantly the right size for a person. Even better is that those ribbon-like feelers it has are 
actually part of its skin! this means they would feel fantastic for cuddling, foreplay, and even 
handjobs! (RibbonJobs?) even better is that they also emit a soothing aura. it can even wrap 
them around your arms and read your feelings so it knows when you're horny! it also has 
access to moves like attract, charm, and of course baby doll eyes! as well as draining kiss. I'm 
sure you know what that would be great for. and most importantly. you can ONLY get a Sylveon 
by having an Eevee that's already got a high affection for you. this means it would already be 
quite into you. so it would make the PERFECT mate! I believe I've made my case for why it's the 
best pokemon for humans. 

 



 

Lubricated Pussy 
 
Things might get messy for what you had in mind, so you take off your [pc.gear] to give yourself 
unrestricted access to your [pc.pussy]. That done, you bring out the jar of goo and pour a 
generous portion into your hand, before you start to smear it across your pubic mound.  Once 
you're satisfied with the coating of the exterior, you move into your eager snatch. You're already 
dripping with excitement, but the slick goo on your digits makes your descent all the more 
simpler, and you effortlessly slide in. It doesn't take long before you're all slick and wet, perfectly 
ready for a quick fuck.  
 
And I bet you’re wondering which pokemon is good for a quick breeding. Not to worry, for I have all 
your answers here. It’s jolteon. yes, yes, another Eeveelution. That’s besides the point tho, jolteon 
weighs 24.5 KG or 54.0 pounds and is on average 2’07”. Now clearly jolteon isn’t as high in HP as 
vaporeon or as large, so you can’t be as rough with it. But, jolteon is able to electrocute its fur. Why 
is this important you ask? Well, some people enjoy pain during sex. And its fur is spiky and full of 
electricity. If that’s your thing then jolteon is probably the mon’ for you. It’s electricity would also just 
be really stimulating during sex. You probably wouldn’t last long, but neither would jolteon. 
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