
Privacy Policy for MailSeen 
 
1. Introduction 
 
Thank you for choosing the MailSeen Extension. We are committed to safeguarding the privacy 
of our users and their data. This Privacy Policy elucidates the nature, scope, and purpose of the 
personal data we collect, use, and process. Furthermore, it informs you of your rights pertaining 
to your data. 
 
2. Definitions 
 
Our privacy policy should be easy to read and understand. To ensure this, we'd first like to 
explain the terminology used: 
 
Personal Data: Any information that personally identifies you or can be used to establish your 
identity. 
 
Processing: Any set of operations performed on personal data, whether automated or not. 
 
Controller: Determines the purposes and means of processing personal data. 
 
3. Data Collection and Use 
 
3.1. Email Data: The core functionality of the MailSeen Extension revolves around tracking and 
processing email addresses to deliver relevant insights. While we collect this data to enrich user 
experience, it remains encrypted, ensuring utmost security. Under no circumstances is this data 
shared, sold, or disclosed to third-party entities. 
 
3.2. Analytics: Our extension collects anonymized interaction data. This helps us understand 
user preferences, optimize user experience, and resolve potential issues. The data we collect 
for analytics is stripped of personally identifiable information and is purely statistical. 
 
3.3. Remote Code & Cloud Run: We leverage Google Cloud Run to host certain functionalities 
of the extension. This ensures our services are scalable, reliable, and efficient. It's important to 
note that Google Cloud Run maintains stringent security protocols, ensuring your data remains 
uncompromised. 
 
4. Data Security 
 
We value your trust in providing your personal data. Hence, we strive to use commercially 
acceptable means to protect it. This includes, but is not limited to, SSL encrypted connections, 
secure cloud storage, and regular security audits. However, remember that no method of 
transmission over the internet or electronic storage is 100% secure. 
 



5. Data Retention 
 
Your personal data is stored only as long as necessary for the fulfillment of the purposes 
outlined in this policy. Beyond that duration, the personal data will be securely deleted unless 
there's a legal obligation to retain it longer. 
 
6. Your Rights 
 
6.1. Right of Access: You have the right to request a copy of the data we hold about you. 
 
6.2. Right to Rectification: If the data we hold about you is inaccurate, you have the right to have 
it corrected. 
 
6.3. Right to Erasure: You can ask us to delete your data under certain circumstances. 
 
6.4. Right to Restriction: You can ask us to restrict the processing of your data under certain 
conditions. 
 
7. Third-party Links 
 
Our extension might include hyperlinks to third-party websites. Please note that we have no 
control over and are not responsible for the content, privacy policies, or practices of third-party 
websites. 
 
8. Changes to This Privacy Policy 
 
Our Privacy Policy might evolve over time. We will notify you of any significant changes by 
posting a prominent notice on our platform. Continued use of the extension after changes are 
implemented constitutes agreement to those changes. 
 
9. Contact Information 
 
Your feedback matters. For any questions, concerns, or feedback regarding this Privacy Policy, 
please don't hesitate to contact us at toto@onepaper.ai. 
 


